2020-12-40 Fire Engine and Ambulance Repair Services

Bid Tabulation by Supplier

CITY OF ALLEN

PURCHASING DIVISION
North Texas Fleet Services Craig’s Car Care Industrial Power LLC
Total Price $5,850.00| Total Price $516.07| Total Price $4,279.00
Line#  Description Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended

1 Fire Apparatus (Engines and Trucks) - Quarterly Service (On-Site - Flat Rate) S 528.00 $ 528.00 |No Bid $225.00 $225.00
2 Fire Apparatus (Engines and Trucks) - Quarterly Service (In Shop - Flat Rate) S 528.00 $ 528.00 [No Bid $189.00 $189.00
3 Fire Apparatus (Engines and Trucks) - Annual Service (On-Site - Flat Rate) S 1,457.00 $ 1,457.00 [No Bid $562.50 $562.50
4 Fire Apparatus (Engines and Trucks) - Annual Service (In Shop - Flat Rate) S 1,457.00 S 1,457.00 [No Bid $472.50 $472.50
5 Fire Apparatus (Engines and Trucks) - Wheels Off Brake Inspection (On-Site - Flat Rate) S 210.00 $ 210.00 [No Bid $187.50 $187.50
6 Fire Apparatus (Engines and Trucks) - Wheels Off Brake Inspection (In Shop - Flat Rate) S 210.00 S 210.00 {No Bid $157.50 $157.50
7 Ambulance - Quarterly Service (On-Site - Flat Rate) S 143.00 S 143.00 [No Bid 225.00 $225.00
8 Ambulance - Quarterly Service (In Shop - Flat Rate) S 143.00 S 143.00 $228.97 $228.97 $189.00 $189.00
9 Ambulance - Fuel Filter Change (On-Site - Flat Rate) S 140.00 S 140.00 [No Bid $100.00 $100.00
10  Ambulance - Fuel Filter Change (In Shop - Flat Rate) S 140.00 S 140.00 $287.10 $287.10 $84.00 $84.00
11 InShop Labor Rate $  105.00 $152.32 $155.00
12 On-Site Labor Rate S 130.00 No Bid $160.00
13 Emergency Service On-Site Labor Rate S 150.00 No Bid $185.00
14 Onan Generators - 150-hour Service (On-Site - Flat Rate) S 149.00 S 149.00 |No Bid $240.00 $240.00
15  Onan Generators - 150-hour Service (In Shop - Flat Rate) S 149.00 S 149.00 [No Bid $232.50 $232.50
16 Onan Generators - 450-hour Service (On-Site - Flat Rate) S 298.00 $ 298.00 [No Bid $720.00 $720.00
17  Onan Generators - 450-hour Service (In Shop - Flat Rate) S 298.00 S 298.00 [No Bid $694.50 $694.50
18 List Parts at Cost Plus Percentage 25% 30%
19 Freon (USA Freon Only) at cost plus percentage 25% 30%

ALL BIDS SUBMITTED FOR THE DESIGNATED PROJECT ARE REFLECTED ON THIS BID TAB SHEET. HOWEVER, THE LISTING OF A BID ON THIS SHEET SHOULD NOT BE CONSTRUED AS
A COMMENT ON THE RESPONSIVENESS OF SUCH A BID OR AS ANY INDICATION THAT THE CITY ACCEPTS SUCH BID AS RESPONSIVE.

THE CITY WILL MAKE A DETERMINATION AS TO THE RESPONSIVENESS OF BIDS SUBMITTED BASED UPON COMPLIANCE WITH ALL APPLICABLE LAWS, CITY OF ALLEN PURCHASING
GUIDELINES, AND PROJECT DOCUMENTS INCLUDING BUT NOT LIMITED TO THE PROJECT SPECIFICATIONS AND CONTACT DOCUMENTS. THE CITY WILL NOTIFY THE SUCCESSFUL
BIDDER UPON AWARD OF THE CONTACT AND ACCORDING TO LAW, ALL BIDS RECEIVED WILL BE AVAILABLE FOR INSPECTION AT THAT TIME
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