
Craig's Car Care
Parts Markup 
Percentage

Suspension, 
Lubrication 
and Exhaust 
System Work AC Services Tune‐Up Services

Under‐Hood 
Services

Vehicle Category Service Cost Time Needed Parts Markup (%) Service Cost Time Needed Service Cost Time Needed Hourly Rate ($) Hourly Rate ($) Hourly Rate ($) Hourly Rate ($)
Vehicles Under 3,800 lbs. (GVW) 45.00$                1 hour 10% 437.00$             4 hours 135.00$             2 hours 115.00$                 115.00$                 115.00$                 115.00$                
SUV's or vans (1/2 ton to 1 ton) 55.00$                1 hour 10% 550.00$             4 hours 135.00$             2 hours 115.00$                 115.00$                 115.00$                 115.00$                
Pickup Trucks (1/2 ton to 3/4 ton) 120.00$              1 hour 10% 550.00$             4 hours 135.00$             2 hours 115.00$                 115.00$                 115.00$                 115.00$                
Pickup Trucks (1 ton to 1 1/2 ton) 120.00$              1 hour 10% 975.00$             4 hours 145.00$             3 hours 115.00$                 115.00$                 115.00$                 115.00$                
Heavy Duty Utility Trucks 150.00$              1 hour 10% 975.00$             8 hours 350.00$             3 hours 150.00$                 150.00$                 150.00$                 150.00$                
20+ Passenger Bus 250.00$              1 hour 10% 975.00$             8 hours 350.00$             4 hours 150.00$                 150.00$                 150.00$                 150.00$                
Police Pursuit Rated Vehicles 89.00$                1 hour 10% 550.00$             4 hours 135.00$             2 hours 150.00$                 150.00$                 150.00$                 150.00$                

Firestone Complete 
Auto Care

Parts Markup 
Percentage

Vehicle Category Service Cost Time Needed Parts Markup (%)
Vehicles Under 3,800 lbs. (GVW) 35.29$                30‐45 minutes 10%
SUV's or vans (1/2 ton to 1 ton) 35.29$                30‐45 minutes 10%
Pickup Trucks (1/2 ton to 3/4 ton) 35.29$                30‐45 minutes 10%
Pickup Trucks (1 ton to 1 1/2 ton) 79.29$                30‐45 minutes 10%

          Craig's Car Care was deemed the only responsive bidder for this solicitation with the ability to provide a level of service up to the City's standards.
Service Location ‐ 1005 W Lucas Rd, Lucas, TX 75002

2020‐10‐17 Vehicle Maintenance and Repair Services
Bid Tabulation by Supplier

Oil & Filter Replacement, Tire 
Rotation, and Fluid Top Off

Brake Pads/
Shoe Replacements

Alignment and Wheel Balancing 
Service

Oil & Filter Replacement, Tire 
Rotation, and Fluid Top Off

Firestone Complete Auto Care was considered responsive for Oil Change and State Inspection Services based on the price and time to complete services.
Two Service Locations ‐ 600 E Stacy Rd, Allen, TX 75002 and 802 S Greenville Ave, Allen, TX 75002

Executive Summary



CRAIGS CAR CARE 

1005 W LUCAS RD

972-941-6700

craig@craigscarcare.com

CRAIGS CAR CARE  

Vehicle Category Service Cost Time to Complete Job

Vehicles Under 3,800 lbs. (GVW) 437.00$  4 hours once on lift

SUV's or vans (1/2 ton to 1 ton) 550.00$  4 hours once on lift

Pickup Trucks (1/2 ton to 3/4 ton) 550.00$  4 hours once on lift

Pickup Trucks (1 ton to 1 1/2 ton) 975.00$  4 hours once on lift

Heavy Duty Utility Trucks 975.00$  8 hours once on lift

20+ Passenger Bus 975.00$  8 hours once on lift

Police Pursuit Rated Vehicles 550.00$  4 hours once on lift

ALL 4 WHEELS All times are dependent to parts availability and arrival time

MACHINE ROTORS

MACHINE DRUMS

PARKING BRAKE SHOES FOR REAR PAD/SHOES SET UP ADD $100.00 EXTRA AS NEEDED

ALL VEHICLES DROPPED OFF WILL RECEIVE A FULL DIGITAL VEHICLE HEALTH INSPECTION WITH AN E MAILED REPORT TO THE DEPARTMENT THEY ARE ASSIGNED TO 

Firestone Complete Auto Care

600 E. Stacy Road

972-390-8741

theoconnors4@gmail.com

Firestone Complete Auto Care

Vehicle Category Service Cost Time to Complete Job

Vehicles Under 3,800 lbs. (GVW) 90.00$  1.5 hours

SUV's or vans (1/2 ton to 1 ton) 90.00$  2 hours

Pickup Trucks (1/2 ton to 3/4 ton) 90.00$  1.5 hours

Pickup Trucks (1 ton to 1 1/2 ton) 90.00$  2 hours

Police Pursuit Rated Vehicles 90.00$  1.5 hours

Heavy Duty Utility Trucks No Bid No Bid

20+ Passenger Bus No Bid No Bid

Please provide " Flat Fee " for

Brake Pad/Shoe Replacements

Please provide " Flat Fee " for

Brake Pad/Shoe Replacements

Bid Tabulation Detail



Service Cost Time to Complete Job Hourly Rate ($) Parts Markup (%)

135.00$                            2 hours once on lift 115.00$                            10%

135.00$                            2 hours once on lift 115.00$                            10%

135.00$                            2 hours once on lift 115.00$                            10%

145.00$                            3 hours once on lift 115.00$                            10%

350.00$                            3 hours once on lift 150.00$                            10%

350.00$                            4 hours once on lift 150.00$                            10%

135.00$                            2 hours once on lift 150.00$                            10%

All times are dependent to parts availability and arrival time

PARKING BRAKE SHOES FOR REAR PAD/SHOES SET UP ADD $100.00 EXTRA AS NEEDED

ALL VEHICLES DROPPED OFF WILL RECEIVE A FULL DIGITAL VEHICLE HEALTH INSPECTION WITH AN E MAILED REPORT TO THE DEPARTMENT THEY ARE ASSIGNED TO 

Service Cost Time to Complete Job Hourly Rate ($) Parts Markup (%)

79.98$                               4 hours 90.00$                               10%

79.98$                               4 hours 90.00$                               10%

79.98$                               4 hours 90.00$                               10%

79.98$                               4 hours 90.00$                               10%

79.98$                               4 hours 90.00$                               10%

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Please provide " Flat Fee " for

Alignment and Wheel Balancing Service

Please provide "Hourly Rate" and “Parts Markup 

Percentage” (not to exceed 10%) for the 

following Under-Car Services: Suspension Work, 

Lubrication and Exhaust System Work

Please provide " Flat Fee " for

Alignment and Wheel Balancing Service

Please provide "Hourly Rate" and “Parts Markup 

Percentage” (not to exceed 10%) for the 

following Under-Car Services: Suspension Work, 

Lubrication and Exhaust System Work



Hourly Rate ($) Parts Markup (%) Hourly Rate ($) Parts Markup (%)

115.00$                            10% 115.00$                            10%

115.00$                            10% 115.00$                            10%

115.00$                            10% 115.00$                            10%

115.00$                            10% 115.00$                            10%

150.00$                            10% 150.00$                            10%

150.00$                            10% 150.00$                            10%

150.00$                            10% 150.00$                            10%

ALL VEHICLES DROPPED OFF WILL RECEIVE A FULL DIGITAL VEHICLE HEALTH INSPECTION WITH AN E MAILED REPORT TO THE DEPARTMENT THEY ARE ASSIGNED TO 

Hourly Rate ($) Parts Markup (%) Hourly Rate ($) Parts Markup (%)

90.00$                               10% 90.00$                               10%

90.00$                               10% 90.00$                               10%

90.00$                               10% 90.00$                               10%

90.00$                               10% 90.00$                               10%

90.00$                               10% 90.00$                               10%

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Please provide "Hourly Rate” and

“Parts Markup Percentage”

(not to exceed 10%) for AC Services

Please provide "Hourly Rate” and

“Parts Markup Percentage”

(not to exceed 10%) for Tune-Up Services

Please provide "Hourly Rate” and

“Parts Markup Percentage”

(not to exceed 10%) for AC Services

Please provide "Hourly Rate” and

“Parts Markup Percentage”

(not to exceed 10%) for Tune-Up Services



Hourly Rate ($) Parts Markup (%) Service Cost Time to Complete Job

115.00$                            10% 45.00$                               Gas engine 1 hour

115.00$                            10% 55.00$                               Gas engine 1 hour

115.00$                            10% 120.00$                            Diesel enigne 1 hour

115.00$                            10% 120.00$                            Diesel enigne 1 hour

150.00$                            10% 150.00$                            Diesel enigne 1 hour

150.00$                            10% 250.00$                            Diesel enigne 1 hour

150.00$                            10% 89.00$                               Gas engine 1 hour

Hourly Rate ($) Parts Markup (%) Service Cost* Time to Complete Job

90.00$                               10% See below 30-45 minutes

90.00$                               10% See below 30-45 minutes

90.00$                               10% See below 30-45 minutes

90.00$                               10% See below 30-45 minutes

90.00$                               10% See below 30-45 minutes

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

*Up to 6 quarts of oil per unit

Conventional Oil = $19.80

Dexos Oil = $36.60

Full Synthetic Oil = $63.80

Please provide your "Flat Fee" for

Oil & Filter Replacements, Tire Rotation,

and Fluid Top Off

Please provide "Hourly Rate” and

“Parts Markup Percentage”

(not to exceed 10%) for Under-Hood Services:

Transmission System Drain or Flush, Electrical 

Please provide "Hourly Rate” and

“Parts Markup Percentage”

(not to exceed 10%) for Under-Hood Services:

Transmission System Drain or Flush, Electrical 

Please provide your "Flat Fee" for

Oil & Filter Replacements, Tire Rotation,

and Fluid Top Off



Labor Cost = $8.50

Filter Cost = $6.99



Please provide “Parts Markup Percentage”

(not to exceed 10%) for Minor Parts

Replacements: Batteries, Filters, Light Bulbs, 

Wiper Blades and Other Minor Parts

Parts Markup (%)

10%

10%

10%

10%

10%

10%

10%

Please provide “Parts Markup Percentage”

(not to exceed 10%) for Minor Parts

Replacements: Batteries, Filters, Light Bulbs, 

Wiper Blades and Other Minor Parts

Parts Markup (%)

10%

10%

10%

10%

10%

No Bid

No Bid



Please provide the answers to the following questions:

Discount off list price for items not listed in the proposal

document to be offered to the City of Allen

What is the "Flat Fee" for diagnostics?

Do you offer a warranty on Parts? Yes

If yes, what is the warranty time period on Parts?

Do you offer a warranty on Labor? Yes

If yes, what is the warranty time period on Labor?

Are your mechanics available to perform work

at City facilities? No

Is your facility certified to perform:

State Inspections Yes

Commercial Motor Vehicle Inspections No

Provide the name of the National Industry Standard

Manual, Electronic Database and Price Lists utilized:

CRAIGS CAR CARE



Craig's Car Care

Diagnostic rates will be billed at $115.00 an hour in 30 minute intervals

None/0%

This should be a time based systm to be fair with all parties with a base labor rate

                  12 Months or 12,000 miles which ever comes first

12 Months or 12,000 miles which ever comes first

Mitchell Guide



Firestone Complete Auto Care

15%

$89.99

Yes

12 months/12,000 miles*

*certain parts have greater warranty

Yes

12 months/12,000 miles

No

Yes

No

Mitchell/AllData



Vehicle Transmission Rebuild Transmission Replacement

Chevrolet Tahoe (Pursuit Rated) NO BID NO BID

Dodge Charger (Pursuit Rated) NO BID NO BID

Ford Interceptor Sedan (Pursuit Rated) NO BID NO BID

Ford Interceptor SUV (Pursuit Rated) NO BID NO BID

Ford 1/2 ton Pickup Trucks NO BID NO BID

Vehicle Transmission Rebuild Transmission Replacement

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

CRAIGS CAR CARE

Craig's Car Care

Please provide an approximate price range for

all vehicle makes and models for model years 2008 through 2017.

Disclaimer:  The City of Allen recognizes the figures listed above as price estimates only  and will be used 

for Budgetary purposes. The City of Allen will not hold Proposers accoutable to these prices.

Additional space is provided below for vehicle makes/models not listed above:



Transmission Rebuild Transmission Replacement

$2,600 - $3,700 Cost + 10%

$3,000 - $3,500 Cost + 10%

$3,000 - $3,500 Cost + 10%

$3,000 - $3,500 Cost + 10%

$2,600 - $3,700 Cost + 10%

Firestone Complete Auto Care



Does your entity provide maintenance and repair

for open-bed and enclosed-bed trailers? Yes

If yes, please complete the list below:

Trailer Systems Price Range

Axles Yes $200.00 TO $10,000

Suspension Yes $200.00  TO $10,000

Wheels and Tires Yes $200.00 TO $10,000

Ramps Yes $100.00 TO $9,000

Brakes (including ABS) Yes $100.00 TO $2,500

Hydraulics Yes $100.00 TO $5,000

Lights and Reflectors Yes $50.00 TO $2,500

Paint NO NO BID

Mud Flaps Yes $25.00 TO $1000.00

Electrical Yes $25.00 to $2500.00

Craig's Car Care



Price Range

Parts & labor No

Parts & labor No

Parts & labor Yes $45 - $150

Parts & labor No

Parts & labor No

Parts & labor No

Parts & labor Yes $15 - $ Max Varies

No

Parts & labor No

Parts & labor No

Craig's Car Care Firestone Complete Auto Care



Craig's Car Care

Bidder shall state terms and conditions of guarantee/warranty below:

Warranty for parts and labor to be covered for 12 months or 12,000 miles whichever comes first. 

Please provide answers to the following questions below:

What extent of services will your business be capable of providing to City? A/C

A/C Repair

A/C Compressor

A/C Recharge

Air Filter (Air Intake Cleaning & Filter Changing)

Heating & Air Conditioning Service

Auto Repair

Imported Japanese Engine Repairs

SUV Repair & Service

Truck Repair & Service

Van Repair & Service

Brakes

Anti-Lock Brake Service & Diagnostics

Brake Calipers

Brake Service and Repair

Brake Fluid Exchange

Brake Pads Replacement

Brake Rotors Replacement

Resurface Brake Rotors

ABS System Service and Repair

Drum and Rotor Service

Hydraulic System Diagnosis and Repair

Brake Inspection

Brake Line and Hose Replacement

Classic Cars

Vintage Auto Repair

Diagnostics

Check Engine Light Diagnostics



Will your business be able to give priority service to Public Safety vehicles?

Will your business be able to give priorty service to all other City vehicles?

Is the equipment in your garage (shop) available to perform these services?

Please fill out the equipment list on the next page.

Number of years engaged in the vehicle maintenance business.

How many auto mechanics do you currently employ?

How many bays are at your proposed service location?

What licenses and certifications do they currently hold?

Please attach photocopies/scanned copies of licenses for verification purposes.

CRAIGS CAR CARE 







Firestone Complete Auto Care

Firestone offers a fixed guarantee - minimum 12 months and 12,000 miles on parts and labor.

Excludes maintenance services, 3 to 5 years manufacturer's warranty on Firestone/Bridgestone

tires against manufacturer defects.  All warranties defined in their terms and conditions.

All tire, service and repairs for vehicles up to 1 ton.

Same day services, with most services completed between 1-2 hours.



Yes

Yes

Yes

Since 1926

41

28



Quantity Name/Type/Model/Year Condition Compliance of Equipment

Quantity Name/Type/Model/Year Condition Compliance of Equipment

1 Challanger/2010 18,000lbs drive on lift/

1 Challanger/2011 12,000lbs A.S. lift/

1 Hunter /2001-2012 14,800lbs lift and alignment unit/ HawkEye Elite

1 Challanger 10,000 lbs high speed twin post lift

Brake Pressure bleeding kit

2 Challnger  2016 12,000 lbs twin post lift

1 Med, rise/2012 6,000lbs lift

1 On car Pro/cut brake lathe 2011

3 Ammco car and truck Brake lathes 1996-2011

1 Miller /Mig welder 1999

1 Set of oxy,accy torch 1996

2 Snap-On Modius Diagnositic systems

1 OTC Tech 2 1996 to present

1 Genisys EVO Diagnostics system 2001

1 Launch X431 Diagnositc system 2012

2 Fluke DVOM 1996-2005

1 Cardone Flash 2 plus reprogramer 2006

5 Shop level PC's/gateway,HP 2009-2012

2 OTC, EVAP testers 2006-2010

2 Suction units 2000-2005

2 OTC Inspection cameras 2009-2012

1 T-robinair Transflush machine

2 Coats wheel ballancers 1999-2010

1 Coats tire machine 2001

2 Bench top Grinders 2008

1 Eviro heated power parts washer 2003

1 Snap-on Parts washer 2002

1 Snap-on media blaster 2005

2 Skye R-134 AC machines 2005-2010

1 Skye R-134 AC reclaimer 2009

1 Skye R-12 AC reclaimer 1996

1 World wide State inspection unit 2012

$350,000 + in specialty and basic hand tools, smaller factory equipment

1 Ford IDS/VES2 factory diagnostics system

4 Battery chargers 12/24 volt

4 Power probe systems

4 On and off site fabrication systems with lathes

Craig's Car Care

Contractor must list all equipment owned to perform the services

and proposed work as required and stated in this proposal:



CRAIGS CAR CARE



Quantity Name/Type/Model/Year Condition

3 Hunter Hawkeye Align 2019 & 2012 Great

2 Coats 70x-AH-3 2019 $ 2009 Good

2 Coats 70x-AH-2 2019 $ 2009 Good

6 Hunter GSP9700 Road Force 2019 & 2009 Great

2 RTI RH5730 A/C 2009 Great

3 Bosch AC 1234-4 2019 Great

3 RTI ArticPro A/C 2019 & 2009 Great

2 GMI Diff Service 2009 Great

3 OTC Leakmaster Smoke Machine Great

3 GMI Auto Exchanges 2019 & 2009 Great

3 GMI Coolant Exchange 2019 & 2009 Great

3 Autal MaxiSys 2019 & 2015 Great

5 ESP Vehicle Inspection Stations 2019 & 2009 Great

27 Up to date vehicle Lifts Great

Firestone Complete Auto Care

Contractor must list all equipment owned to perform the services

and proposed work as required and stated in this proposal:





Compliance of Equipment

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Contractor must list all equipment owned to perform the services

and proposed work as required and stated in this proposal:







CRAIGS CAR CARE








