CITY OF ALLEN INVITATION FOR BID #2020-10-5 Printing Services
BID TABLUATION - Opening 11/26/19 2:00 PM \___ |

\___ |
CITY OF ALLEN

Contract Award Amount
PURCHASING

AC Printing LLC $127.500 Booklets, Brochuers, Specialty Business Cards, Flyers, Cardstock, Forms, Misc.
Alphagraphics 99 $15,000 City of Allen Business Cards
Logan Graphics $7,500 Stationary
Girard Investments Inc. . "
AC PRINTING dba Alphagraphics 99 Logan Graphics Marfield
DESCRIPTION ANNUAL Extended Extended Extended
# estary | YoM | unit Price Price Unit Price Price Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price Price

CITY OF ALLEN BUSINESS CARDS: AWARD TO ALPHA GRAPHICS 99, BEST VALUE

BUSINESS CARDS 3 1/2" X 2" 500 CARDS PER BOX. FRONT: 2 COLOR LOGO, 1

2" X 3.5" STANDARD BUSINESS CARDS PRINTED 2/COLORS (PMS 541 & 5773) LITHO

! |COLOR TEXT BACK: GOLOR WITH WHITE COA LOGO GENTERED. " = $ 4500 |$ 562500 |8 43.10 5387.50 | $  57.24 715500 | $ 5555 6,943.75
2 |COLOR TEXT. BAGK: GOLOR WITH WHITE GOA LOGO CENTERED. | " w5 | e
: : : $ 4000 |$ 500000 |8 3052 381500 | $ 4676 584500 | $ 4555 5,693.75
5 [BUSINESS CARDS 3 1/2" X 2" 250 CARDS PER BOX. FRONT: 2 COLORLOGO, 1 100 EA
COLOR TEXT. BACK: BLANK $  38.00|S 380000|8 2416 2416.00 | $ 4436 4436.00 | §  32.25 3,225.00
4 [BUSINESS CARDS 3 1/2" X 2" 500 CARDS PER BOX. FRONT: 2 COLORLOGO, 1 100 EA
COLOR TEXT. BACK: BLANK $  4000[$ 400000)$ 3170 317000 | $  48.84 488400 | $  41.35 4,135.00
5 |BUSINESS CARDS 3 1/2" X 2" 500 CARDS PER BOX. FRONT: 6+ colors. BACK: Blue 5 BOX
with white logos $ 5000[$  250.00)$ 43.10 21550 | $  57.24 28620 |$  41.35 206.75
g | SOLICITOR'S ID CARD, 3 %" x 2', # 80 GLACIER WHITE, 1 SIDE PRINT, NUMBERED, 5 Bx
BLACK INK, 250 PER BOX $ 50005 25000 |S 4292 21460 | $  69.93 349.65
$  18,925.00 15,218.60 22,955.85 20,204.25

STATIONARY: AWARD TO LOGAN GRAPHICS, BEST VALUE

PRINTING OF LETTERHEAD ON #10 ENVELOPES, 24LBS/B&W LOGO WITH RETURN
ADDRESS, - 500 PER BOX

BX

$ 3500

$ 525.00

$ 7831

1,174.65

25.80

387.00

$

6 1 BX
W/BREEDS ON 80# CLASSIC BARONIAL IVORY SMOOTH COVER
$ 56.00|8% 56.00 | $ 144.34 14434 1%  76.06 76.06 | $ 106.20 106.20
7 2" X 3.5" PRINTED COLOR FRONT AND COLOR BACK W/BLEEDS ON 100# COUGAR 1 BX
DIGITAL SMOOTH WHITE COVER, 500/box $ 5000]|$% 5000)$ 5981 59.811$ 7290 7290)$ 61.60 61.60
$ 106.00 204.15 148.96 167.80

76.30

1,144.50

PRINTING OF LETTERHEAD #10 STRATHMORE ENVELOPES — TWO COLOR LOGO &
10 |Address (BLUE & RED), 25% Cotton bright white, 24LB writing, RETURN ADDRESS - 500 15
PER BOX

BX

$ 120.00

$ 1,800.00

$ 198.31

2,974.65

78.67

1,180.05

$

164.95

2,474.25

PRINTING OF LETTERHEAD #10 ENVELOPES PRINTED 2/COLOR (PMS 541 & PMS
11 |5773) LITHO ON #24 CLASSIC CREST BRONIAL IVORY SMOOTH WRITING, 250 PER 1
BOX

BOX

$ 215.00

$ 215.00

$ 197.74

197.74

$

195.47

195.47

$

158.75

158.75

A2 NOTE ENVELOPES PRINTED 1/COLOR ADDRESS (PMS 541) BACK FLAP 250 PER
BOX

BOX

$ 95.00

$ 95.00

$ 7496

74.96

$

93.21

93.21

$

73.95

73.95

PRINTING OF LETTERHEAD PAPER, TWO COLOR, # 24 STRATHMORE BONDED

PAPER, 8 1/2" X 11", 260 SHEETS PER BOX 26

BOX

$ 35.00

$ 910.00

$ 14218

3,696.68

$

23.75

617.50

$

122.80

3,192.80




CITY OF ALLEN INVITATION FOR BID #2020-10-5 Printing Services
BID TABLUATION - Opening 11/26/19 2:00 PM

Contract Award Amount

PURCHASING

CITY OF ALLEN

AC Printing LLC $127.500 Booklets, Brochuers, Specialty Business Cards, Flyers, Cardstock, Forms, Misc.
Alphagraphics 99 $15,000 City of Allen Business Cards
Logan Graphics $7,500 Stationary
AC PRINTING Girard Investments Inc. Logan Graphics Marfield
dba Alphagraphics 99 9 P
DESCRIPTION ANNUAL Extended Extended Extended
# estary | YoM | unit Price Price Unit Price Price Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price Price
PRINTING OF STANDARD LETTERHEAD PRINTED 2/COLORS COA LOGO CENTERED
14 |TOP OF PAGE, 2 LINE ADDRESS CENTERED BOTTOM OF PAGE, STRATHMORE 25% 20 BOX
COTTON, 250 per box
P $  5000[$ 1,00000)s 142.18 284360 |$ 2324 (% 464.80 | $ 122.80 2,456.00
15 |PRINTING OF LETTERHEAD PAPER, THREE COLOR, #24 STRATHMORE BONDED ) BOX
PAPER, 8 1/2' X 11" 250 SHEETS PER BOX $ 65005 13000 |5 184.54 369.08 | $ 10032 | § 20064 | $ 164.70 329.40
PRINTING OF MEMO LETTER, 8.5" X 11", BRIGHT WHITE, BLACK POLICE LOGO AT
16 |THE TOP, LINE BRODER, BOTTOM CENTER 3 TEXT LINES AND COA LOGO, 250 PER 2 BOX
BOX $ 60008 12000 | §  60.62 12124 |$ 3020 | § 6040 | § 103.75 207.50
PRINTING OF LETTERHEAD PAPER, POLICE LOGO 2 COLORS AT THE TOP
17 |CENTERED, 3 ADDRESS LINE PRINTING WITH SMALL COA LOGO AT THE BOTTOM, 5 BOX
CENTERED, STRATHMORE 25% COTTON, 24#. 250 SHEETS PER BOX, IVORY
$ 12000 [$  600.00|$ 142.18 71090 |$  49.09 | § 24545 |$ 11355 567.75
18 |PLAIN # 24 STRATHMORE PAPER 25# COTTON 8 1/2" X 11" 250 SHEETS PER BOX 10 BOX
BLANK $  1500]s 15000 | § 2268 22680 | $ 2144 | 21440 |$  25.00 250.00
19 |A2 SIZE FOLDER NOTE CARD PRINTED 2/COLORS (PMS 541 & PMS 5773) LITHO ] BOX
SCORED TO FOLD TO 4.25" X 5.57, 250 per box $ 12000 |$ 12000 |$ 158.97 158.97 | $ 19618 | $ 196.18
LINEN PANEL NOTECARDS, 5 %" x 4 %", WHEN FOLDED, TWO COLOR LOGO,
20 | WHITE. BOX 250 10 BOX
: $ 150.00 [$  1,500.00 | $ 174.00 1,740.00 | $ 4655 | $ 465.50
LINEN NOTECARD ENVELOPES, 5 %” x 4 3/8”, WHITE WITH RETURN ADDRESS ON
21 | BACK FLAP. Box 250 10 BOX
: $ 12500 [$ 125000 ]$ 103.88 1,038.80 | $ 3871 |$ 387.10
LINEN PANEL NOTECARDS, 5 %" x 4 %", WHEN FOLDED, 1 COLOR LOGO GOLF FOIL
22 |PRINT, WHITE. BOX 250 ! BOX
: : $ 165.00 S 165.00 | § - - | NoBid No Bid
23 |LINEN NOTECARD ENVELOPES, 5 %" x 4 3/8", WHITE WITH RETURN ADDRESS ON ] BOX
BACK FLAP GOLF FOIL PRINT. Box 250 B 135.00 | 5 ) N . No Bid
54 | SELF STICK MAILING LABELS, 3 %" x 4%', WHITE, TWO COLOR LOGO, RETURN 2 B
ADDRESS, 6 LABELS PER SHEET, 100 SHEETS PER BOX
$  90.00[$ 180000]$ 4365 873.00 | $ 3509 | 701.80 | $ 8245 1,649.00
25 | MEMO PADS 5%" x 8%", BLUE PAPER WITH BLUE LOGO BOTTOM CENTER; 50 PGS 0 PK
PER PAD, 10 PADS PER PACK $  5000[$ 250000]$ 1432 716.00 |$ 826§ 41300 | §  54.55 2,727.50
26 | MEMO PADS 5%" x 8%, WHITE PAPER WITH BLACK LOGO BOTTOM CENTER; 50 0 PK
PGS PER PAD, 10 PADS PER PACK $ 4500 [$  225000]$ 1228 61400 |$  761|$ 38050 | $  70.50 3,525.00
57 | MEMO PADS, APPROX. 4% x 5", YELLOW PAPER WITH BAW LOGO BOTTOM 100 PK
CENTER 50 PAGES PER PAD, 20 PADS PER PACK $  5000[$ 5000.00|$ 1372 1,372.00 | $  7.80 | § 780.00 | $ 5455 5,455.00
g1 [107X 13" BOOKLET ENVELOPES PRINTED 2/COLORS (pms 541 & pms 5773) LITHO 500 BOX
ON 28# WHITE WOVEN ECONOMY BOND BOOKLET ENVS 200,00 109.165.00 140,00
BOOKLETS AND BROCHURES: AWARD TO AC PRINTING LLC, BEST VALUE
ALLEN VISITOR GUIDE - 20 page self cover 100# gloss book 4/4+bleeds, 11"x17" flat,
28 8.5x11 final folded stapled 5,000 EA
$ 075|$ 3752.00]|% - - |s o78]|s 3,909.00 | $  0.94 4,700.00




CITY OF ALLEN INVITATION FOR BID #2020-10-5 Printing Services
BID TABLUATION - Opening 11/26/19 2:00 PM

Contract Award Amount

AC Printing LLC $127.500 Booklets, Brochuers, Specialty Business Cards, Flyers, Cardstock, Forms, Misc.

Alphagraphics 99 $15,000 City of Allen Business Cards

Logan Graphics $7,500 Stationary

CITY OF ALLEN

PURCHASING

AC PRINTING

Girard Investments Inc.
dba Alphagraphics 99

Logan Graphics

Marfield

DESCRIPTION

ANNUAL
EST QTY

uom

Unit Price

Extended
Price

Unit Price

Extended
Price

Unit Price | Extended

Price

Extended
Unit Price Price

29

HR Benefit Booklet, STAPLED AND TRIMMED, APPROX. 10 % “ x 8 1/2" , 80# GLOSS
WHITE PAPER EXTERIOR, TWO SIDED PRINT (30 PAGES FINISHED INC. COVER
PAGE), INCLUDING MULTICOLOR TEXT. INTERIOR MATTE PAGES 100" FULL COLOR

850

EA

3.69

$

3,136.50

$ 242 $ 2,058.62

$ 757 |$ 643450

30

Allen Budget Books,8.5" X 11"Finished,300pg + Cover, Cover 100 Ib gloss cover,4/0
Text:100 Ib Gloss Text,4/4,PUR Glue-Perfect Bind along the 11" edge,Qty 25

25

EA

$

102.12

$

2,553.00

$ 899118 2,247.75

31

CITY OF ALLEN FALL/WINTER RECREATION GUIDE (LIFE IN ALLEN) 72 PG _ COVER
8.75" X 5.75" FINISHED SIZE. Cover 60# Cougar, inside 50# opaque stock, sheet fed
printing. 39,250 MAILED, 1,250 DELIVERED TO CITY OF ALLEN

40500

EA

0.68

27,552.15

No Bid No Bid

32

CITY OF ALLEN WINTER/SPRING RECREATION GUIDE (LIFE IN ALLEN) 72 PG _
COVER 8.75" X 5.75" FINISHED SIZE. Cover 60# Cougar, inside 50# opaque stock, sheet
fed printing. 38,407 MAILED, 2,000 DELIVERED TO CITY OF ALLEN

40000

EA

0.68

27,320.00

No Bid No Bid

33

CITY OF ALLEN SPRING/SUMMER RECREATION GUIDE (LIFE IN ALLEN) 76 PG _
COVER 8.75 " X 5.75" FINISHED SIZE. Cover 60# Cougar, inside 50# opaque stock, sheet
fed printing. 38,000 MAILED, 2,000 DELIVERED TO CITY OF ALLEN

40000

EA

0.71

28,352.00

No Bid No Bid

34

CITY OF ALLEN TRASH AND RECYCLING GUIDELINES. 12 page booklet, 100lb, 11 x 17,
folded To 8.5" x 11", stapled, in color, 41,500 printed with 38,500 mailed and rest delivered
to 305 Century Parkway, Allen, TX 75013

41500

EA

0.28

11,769.40

No Bid No Bid

35

WATER QUALITY REPORT, 11" X 25.5" TRI FOLDED TO 8 1/2 x 11", FINAL FOLD SIZE
81/2" x 3 2/3", 60LB WHITE OFFSET GLOSS 4 COLOR 2 SIDE PRINT (NO BLEED)
2,000 shipped to City Hall and the rest to the Utility billing company DataProse

35000

EA

0.11

$

3,675.00

$ 01418 4,929.75

$ 017 1%  5,950.00

36

EDUCATOR EXPO BOOK, 11" X 17" FOLDED TO 8.5" X 11", GLOSSY, FULL COLOR,
STAPLED

150

EA

2.94

$

441.00

No Bid No Bid

55

WELCOME TO CITY OF ALLEN BROCHURE, 14" X 8 %", #80 GLOSS WHITE, TWO
SIDED PRINT, TWO COLORS, RED/BLUE TRIFOLD

1500

EA

0.26

390.00

957.14

$ 024§ 364.80

56

FACTS AND FIGURES HIGHLIGHTS BROCHURE. FULL COLOR 2 SIDES, 8.5" X14™ TRI
FOLDED TO 8.5'X4.75', 80# GLOSSY WHITE PAPER

500

0.50

250.00

427.78

$ 048 | $ 241.20

57

PURCHASING DEPARTMENT BROCHURE. FULL COLOR 2 SIDES, 8.5" X14™ TRI
FOLDED TO 8.5" X 4.75" , 80# GLOSSY WHITE PAPER

250

0.76

190.00

252.34

$ 09218 230.40

58

GUIDE FOR ALLEN PUBLIC OFFICIALS BOOKLET, CARDSTOCK COVER WITH ONE
SIDE PRINT, TWO COLOR LOGO, BLACK INK, INSIDE 16 PAGES WITH 15 PAGES
TWO SIDED PRINT, BLACK INK, FOLDED, STAPLED AND TRIMMED TO 5 1/2" x 8 1/2"
Cover 90# INDEX

100

EA

1.75

175.00

$ 234§ 233.68

59

CITY CHARTER BOOKLET, CARDSTOCK COVER WITH 2 COLOR LOGO, BLUE INK, 14
PAGE, TWO SIDE PRINT, BLACK INK, FOLDED, STAPLED AND TRIMMED TO 5 1/2" x 8
1/2". Cover 90# INDEX

100

EA

1.75

175.00

$ 224 1% 223.60

60

CITY COUNCIL RULES OF ORDER AND PROCEDURE BOOKLET, CARDSTOCK
COVER WITH 2 COLOR LOGO, 7 PAGE, TWO SIDED PRINT, BLACK INK, FOLDED,
STAPLED AND TRIMMED TO 5 1/2" x 8 1/2" Cover 90# INDEX

100

1.58

158.00

193.34




CITY OF ALLEN INVITATION FOR BID #2020-10-5 Printing Services
BID TABLUATION - Opening 11/26/19 2:00 PM \__ |

CITY OF ALLEN

Contract Award Amount
PURCHASING

AC Printing LLC $127.500 Booklets, Brochuers, Specialty Business Cards, Flyers, Cardstock, Forms, Misc.
Alphagraphics 99 $15,000 City of Allen Business Cards
Logan Graphics $7,500 Stationary
AC PRINTING Girard Investments Inc. Logan Graphics Marfield
dba Alphagraphics 99 9 P
DESCRIPTION ANNUAL Extended Extended Extended
# estary | YoM | unit Price Price Unit Price Price Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price Price
63 CITY OF ALLEN CONVENTION & VISITORS BUREAU TABLE TENT 4.5" X 18", 250 EA
FOLDABLE INTO A TRIANGLE 6" TALL SIDE WHEN FOLDED, GLOSSY, FULL COLOR
$ 0.60 [ $ 150.00 | $ 046 | $ 115201 $ - $ -
9x12 DUAL POCKET FOLDER 4" INSIDE POCKETS W/BC SLITS IN POCKET BLIND
65 |EMBOSSED LOGO ON FRONT COVER ON 80# CLASSIC LAID PEPPERED MOSS 1000 EA
COVER- 'ALLEN' die belongs to the City $ 1858 1,850.00 | $ R $ R No Bid No Bid

FLYERS, CARDSTOCK, CARBONLESS FORMS, MISC. FORMS: AWARD TO AC PRINTING LLC, BEST VALUE

DOOR HANGERS 65 LB ASTRO BRIGHT HUE COVER STOCK 3 5/8" X 8 1/2', BLACK

37 4000 EA
INK $ 0073 288.00 |$ 007§ 26812 |$  0.06[$ 235.75
33 | DOOR HANGERS, BRIGHT BLUE COVER STOCK, 4 1/4' X 11", 2 SIDED PRINT, BLACK| 4000 EA
INK $  021]s 207.00 |$ 013§ 13422 |$ 022§ 220.00
DOOR HANGERS, BRIGHT YELLOW COVER STOCK, 4 1/4" X 11", 2 SIDED PRINT,
39 4000 EA
BLACKINK $  009]s 348.00 |$ 010§ 388.38|$  0.09 % 358.00
DOOR HANGERS, BRIGHT YELLOW COVER STOCK, 3 5/8" X 8.5", 1 SIDED PRINT,
40 5000 EA
BLACKINK $  006]$ 300.00 |$ 006 |$ 31893 |$ 006§ 321.40
DOOR HANGERS, BRIGHT GREEN COVER STOCK, 4 1/4" X 11", 2 SIDED PRINT,
41 4000 EA
BLACKINK $  009]s$ 348.00 |$ 010§ 388.38|$  0.09 % 358.00
DOOR HANGERS, FLORESCENT PINK COVER STOCK, 4 1/4" X 11", 2 SIDED PRINT,
42 4000 EA
BLACKINK $  009]s$ 348.00 |$ 010§ 388.38|$  0.09 % 358.00
43 | DOOR HANGERS, RED CARDSTOCK, 4 1/4" x 11", TWO SIDED PRINT, BLACK INK, 4000 EA
TEAR OFF SECTION APPROX 2" ON BOTTOM $  009]s 36000|$  0.11]$ 451750 0.10$ 397.30
ARREST NOTICE CARD, 65LB BRIGHT YELLOW CARDSTOCK, 4 % x 5 %" ONE SIDE
44 500 EA
PRINT, BLACK INK. $ 010(s$ 50.00 |$ 006 |$ 31.32|$ 013§ 64.05|$  0.02 $88.80
45 | WATER BILL INSERT,1 SIDE PRINT, TRI-FOLD, 60LB WHITE PAPER, BLACK INK, 8 %" | 5,00 EA
X1 $ 003|$  80000]|$ 005|$ 151628]3 003[$ 1,10400 | $  0.03 $924.48
WATER BILL INSERT, 2 SIDE PRINT, TRI-FOLD, 60LB OFFSET WHITE PAPER, BLACK
46 17y 41" 32000 EA
INK, 8 %" x 11 $ 0033 864.00|$  006|$ 202768|$ 004($ 1171208 004 |$ 134048
WATER BILL INSERT, 1 SIDE PRINT, TRI-FOLD, 60LB COLOR RECYCLABLE PAPER,
47 17y 11" 32000 EA
BLACKINK, 8 %2"x 11 $ 004[$ 112000|$ 005|8% 1631.13]$ 004]|$ 1232008  003|$ 101286
4 | WATER BILL INSERT, 2 SIDE PRINT, TRI-FOLD, 60LB COLOR PAPER, BLACK INK, 8 32000 EA
vx $ 004|s 121600])$ 007|$ 214204]3 0043 1,276.80 | $  0.05|$  1,496.90
49 | WATER BILL INSERT, TWO SIDE PRINT, TRI-FOLD, 60LB WHITE, 3 COLOR, 8 %" x 11”| 32000 EA
$ 005|$ 1568008 012|$ 389705]s 005]|$ 1,75360 | $  012|$  3.886.40
5o | WATER BILL INSERT, TWO SIZE PRINT, TRI FOLD, WHITE 80LB GLOSS BOOK, 4/4, 32,000 EA
MULTI COLOR PRINT ' $ 005|$ 172800]$ 020|$ 510763 o007]$ 2,115.20 $ 39.60
51 | SPEAKER CARDS, 67LB VELUM BRISTOL BLUE STOCK 8 1/2" x 11" PRINTED ON 1000 EA
BOTH SIDES PERFORATED IN MIDDLE, BLACK INK s o020|s 2000ls o1sls w2sals  o12ls 117.04
57 | SPEAKER CARDS, 67LB VELUM BRISTOL TAN STOCK 8 1/2'x 11" PRINTED ON BOTH| EA
SIDES PERFORATED IN MIDDLE
$ 020[$  20000]$ o016]s 16254 | 012§ 117.04
53 [TAN CARD STOCK - 8 1/2" x 5 1/2", 2 SIDE PRINT, BLACK INK 500 EA

$ 015([$ 75.00 1% 086 |$ 42778 | $ 011§ 56.65




CITY OF ALLEN INVITATION FOR BID #2020-10-5 Printing Services
BID TABLUATION - Opening 11/26/19 2:00 PM

Contract Award Amount

PURCHASING

CITY OF ALLEN

AC Printing LLC $127.500 Booklets, Brochuers, Specialty Business Cards, Flyers, Cardstock, Forms, Misc.
Alphagraphics 99 $15,000 City of Allen Business Cards
Logan Graphics $7,500 Stationary
AC PRINTING Girard Investments Inc. Logan Graphics Marfield
dba Alphagraphics 99 9 P
DESCRIPTION ANNUAL Extended Extended Extended
# EST QTY UOM | unit Price Price Unit Price Price Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price Price
54 TEEN COURT BROCHURE, 14" X 8 '.", FOLDS TO 8 %" X 3 %", #80 GLOSS WHITE 500 EA
PAPER , TWO SIDE PRINT, TWO COLORS, RED AND BLUE INK, QUAD FOLD
$ 050 [ $ 250.00 | $ - - $ 048 [ $ 241.20
67 |FULL COLOR 8.5"X11" MAILERS, 100 LB GLOSSY 40000 EA $ 005 s 1,800.00 | § } } s 007 s 2.976.00
RECORDS MANAGEMENT PROGRAM PACKING LIST STICKER LABEL: 5.5"X8.5"
68 |(8"X11" CUT IN HALF) ADHESIVE PAPER, PEEL BACKING, PRINT BLACK INK ONE 500 EA
SIDE, BRIGHT NEON PINK PAPER.
$ 037 (% 185.00 | $ - - $ 035($ 173.85
69 4.25"X5.5" FLOURESCENT GREEN STICKER, BLACK INK PRINTED FRONT, BLACK 1000 EA
INK PRINTED BACK OF STICKER, KISS CUT '0' score , 1/8 IN. EDGE $ 035 | $ 35200 | § } } s 017 | $ 173.85
NEON ORANGE STICKER, PRINTED FRONT BLACK INK, CRACK AND PEEL BACK
0 6.5"X5.5" 1000 EA
) ) $ 021 (8% 210.00 | $ - - $ 025($ 252.90
CARDSTOCK FLYER, GLOSSY, FULL COLOR FRONT & BACK , 8.5"X3.5" MATTE, 100#
™ [siLk cover 250 EA
$ 034 (3 85.00 | $ 0.29 73331 8% 058 [$ 14420 | $ 036 | $ 89.80
CARDSTOCK FLYER, GLOSSY, FULL COLOR FRONT , 8.5"X3.5" MATTE, 100# SILK
72 COVER 250 EA
$ 032 (% 80.00 | $ 0.20 49.78 | $ 058 [$ 14420 | $ 023]$ 57.55
73 |20# FLYER, GLOSSY, FULL COLOR FRONT AND BACK, 8.5"X3.5", 100# SILK COVER 250 EA
$ 034 (3 85.00 | $ - - $ 058 [$ 144.20 | $ 036 | $ 90.70
74 SERVICE CARDS: YELLOW CARDSTOCK CUT TO 6 PIECES, APPROX. 3.5"X4.5" 1000 EA
BLACK INK PRINTED FRONT $ 0.09[$ 90.00 | $ - - $ 0.08 [$ 79.60 | $ 010 $ 104.60
75 |GLOSSY WHITE 80# CARDSTOCK, BLACK INK FRONT PRINT, 8.5"X5.5" 250 EA
$ 028 [$ 70.00 | $ 0.11 2756 | $ 026 [$ 64.08 | $ 034 1% 86.15
76 POLICE DEPARTMENT STATEMENT FORMS 8.5"X11" PAPER 20# GREEN, BLACK INK, 2500 EA
FRONT AND BACK PRINT (ONE SIDE ENGLISH, ONE SIDE SPANISH)
$ 007 [$ 165.00 | $ 0.08 20557 | $ 007 [$ 168.00 | $ 012 (% 305.50
77 POLICE DEPARTMENT STATEMENT FORMS 8.5"X11" PAPER 20# PINK, BLACK INK, 2500 EA
FRONT AND BACK PRINT (ONE SIDE ENGLISH, ONE SIDE SPANISH)
$ 007 [$ 165.00 | $ 0.08 20557 | $ 007 (8% 168.00 | $ 012 (% 305.50
78 18.5"X11" FLYER, FULL COLOR FRONT, PLAIN BACK, WHITE PAPER 20# RECYCLED 500 EA
$ 035§ 175.00 | $ 0.24 120991 $ 020 [$ 100.90 | $ 025§ 127.30
8.5"X11" FLYER, FULL COLOR FRONT AND BACK, PLAIN BACK, WHITE PAPER 20#
79 500 EA
RECYCLED $  025(s 12500 |$ 044 21856 |$ 031§ 154.85 |8 046 |$ 231.30
80 |PRINTING 8.5" X 11" WHITE 20# RECYCLE PAPER, BLACK INK FRONT AND BACK 500 EA
$ 017 [ $ 85.00 | $ 0.12 59.38 | $ 012 [$ 61.05|$ 020§ 100.30
81 |PRINTING 8.5" X 11" WHITE 20# RECYCLE PAPER, BLACK INK FRONT ONLY 500 EA
$ 0.15 [ $ 75.00 | $ 0.08 38.81]$ 0.10 [ $ 50.05 | $ 014 [ $ 71.15
82 |8.5" X 11" TRIFOLD, 80# MATTE, FULL COLOR FRONT AND BACK 250 EA
$ 075 [ $ 187.50 | $ 0.59 148.04 | § 055§ 136.68 | $ 070 [ § 174.75
83 |8.5" X 11" TRIFOLD, 80# GLOSSY, FULL COLOR FRONT AND BACK 250 EA
$ 075 [ $ 187.50 | $ 0.59 148.04 1 § 055§ 136.68 | $ 070 [ § 174.75
PRINTING ON 2 PART CARBONLESS PAPER, ONE SIDE PRINT, BLACK INK WHITE,
84 "y 49" 3000 EA
CANARY 8 1/2" X 11 $  011]s 33000|$ 0.4 424450  014]$ 4152008 023 ]$ 677.80




CITY OF ALLEN INVITATION FOR BID #2020-10-5 Printing Services
BID TABLUATION - Opening 11/26/19 2:00 PM

Contract Award Amount

CITY OF ALLEN
PURCHASING

AC Printing LLC $127.500 Booklets, Brochuers, Specialty Business Cards, Flyers, Cardstock, Forms, Misc.
Alphagraphics 99 $15,000 City of Allen Business Cards
Logan Graphics $7,500 Stationary
AC PRINTING Girard Investments Inc. Logan Graphics Marfield
dba Alphagraphics 99 9 P
DESCRIPTION ANNUAL Extended Extended Extended
# EST QTY UOM | unit Price Price Unit Price Price Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price Price
PRINTING ON 2 PART CARBONLESS PAPER, ONE SIDE PRINT, BLACK INK WHITE,
85 A 2500 EA
CANARY 8 1/2" X 11" PRE CUT $  012(s 205.00|$ 020§ 48760 |$ 014§ 359.00 |$ 023§ 684.60
PRINTING ON 2 PART CARBONLESS PAPER, ONE SIDE PRINT, BLACK INK, WHITE
86 " h 500 EA
CANARY 9 1/4" x 4 1/4 $  020]s 100008 016§ 80.00|$ 016($ 7950 |$ 022§ 109.60
PRINTING ON 2 PART CARBONLESS PAPER, ONE SIDE PRINT, BLACK INK, WHITE
87 |CANARY 5 1/2" x 4 114" 500 EA
$ 0.16 | $ 80.00]$ 013]$ 6485|% 014 (% 69.00|$ 0.181|% 89.90
PRINTING ON 2 PART CARBONLESS PAPER, TWO SIDED PRINT, BLACK INK, WHITE
88 | CANARY 5 1/2" x 4 1/4" 500 EA
$ 019 (8% 95.00]$ 017]$ 8542|$ 014§ 6960|$ 027]% 132.80
PRINTING ON 2 PART CARBONLESS PAPER, TWO SIDE PRINT, BLACK INK; WHITE,
89 CANARY, 8 1/2" X 11", Minimum order 2000 (Anticipated usage: 1500 restaurant inspection 3500 EA
report, 500 pool inspection report, 200 food truck inspection, 200 temporary event
inspection, 500 notice of violation report) $ 033 |$ 116375 | $ _ $ _ $ 018 | $ 623.00 NO BID
g0 |PRINTING ON 2 PART CARBONLESS PAPER, TWO SIDE PRINT, BLACK INK; WHITE, 2000 EA
PINK, 8 1/2" X 5.5" VERTICAL $ 012]$% 245.00|$ 012§ 231.201$ 009 |$ 17460 |$ 008 |$ 152.50
g1 |PRINTING ON 3 PART CARBONLESS PAPER, TWO SIDE PRINT, BLACK INK; WHITE, 500 EA
PINK, CANARY, 8.5" X 11" $ 0368 180.00|$ 0388 18949 |$ 030§ 149.90 | 0518 254.90
PRINTING ON 3 PART CARBONLESS PAPER, ONE SIDE PRINT, BLACK INK; WHITE,
92 . " 500 EA
PINK, 8.5" x 11 $ 026 |$% 130.00]$  030]$ 14907]$  026($ 13095|$ 042]% 212.00
g3 |PRINTING ON 3 PART CARBONLESS PAPER, ONE SIDE PRINT, BLACK INK; WHITE, 500 EA
PINK, 5 1/2" x 8 1/2" HORIZONTAL $ 018($ 90.00|$ 021§ 10465|$ 018§ 91.05|$ 028§ 141.25
PRINTING ON 2 PART CARBONLESS PAPER, ONE SIDE PRINT, BLACK INK; WHITE,
94 " " 500 EA
CANARY, 5 1/2" x 8 1/2 $ 020 8% 100.00]$ 016]$ 80.18|$ 0.16|$ 7950 |$  022]% 109.60
g5 |PRINTING 3 PART CARBONLESS PAPER ONE SIDE PRINT, NUMBERED, BLACK INK; 1000 EA
WHITE, CANARY AND PINK, 8 1/2" x 3 1/2" $  012(s$ 1150008 020§ 200.02|$ 047 ($ 16990 |8 016 |$ 162.55
96 |PRINTING ON 3 PART CARBONLESS PAPER, 1 SIDE PRINT, BLACK INK; 6 1/5" X 5" 250 EA
$ 028 (% 70.00]$ 030]$ 7534|$  028($ 7070|$  041]% 102.50
TICKET BOOKS (CITATIONS)- PRINTING ON 3 PART CARBONLESS, WHITE, GREEN,
o7 |CANARY, 1 SIDE PRINT, INDIVIDUAL CITATION NUMBERED IN RED. BLACK INK, 10000 EA
APPROX. 4 1/2" x 10 1/2", 400 BOOKS IN A PACK WITH 25 TICKETS IN EACH BOOK,
WRAP AROUND COVER $  011]s  1,00000|8 032]$ 315200 ] NoBid | NoBid
Additional Items Response

What are your setup and art fees?

*all print jobs have setup
and delivery included in price
submitted. Only if changes
are made after a pdf proof is
sent do we charge the client.
Those are as below: Pre
press charges for changes is
$35.00/hr Design
charges for projects from
concept to finish - $45.00 / hr

$20.00 Setup Fee. $85.00
Design Fee

$65.00 per hour with $20.00
minimum

Graphic Design billable at
$90/hr




CITY OF ALLEN INVITATION FOR BID #2020-10-5 Printing Services

BID TABLUATION - Opening 11/26/19 2:00 PM

Contract Award Amount

Booklets, Brochuers, Specialty Business Cards, Flyers, Cardstock, Forms, Misc.

CITY OF ALLEN

PURCHASING

AC Printing LLC $127.500
Alphagraphics 99 $15,000 City of Allen Business Cards
Logan Graphics $7,500 Stationary
AC PRINTING Girard Investments Inc. Logan Graphics Marfield
dba Alphagraphics 99 9 P
DESCRIPTION ANNUAL Extended Extended Extended
# EST QTY UOM | unit Price Price Unit Price Price Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price Price

% discount for additional products not listed

10% - 15% based on
projects qty and
specifications

25% discount

All future quotes will be
competitively priced and
discounted on a job by job basis

If given, it will be given at
time of order
custom branded online

Describe any additional value-added services included?

*Please refer to attached
value added services
document. Based on volume
of usage on stationery, AC
Printing is willing to print
shells for the City and fulfill
on demand and help get the
unit cost down on line items 1
4,9, 10, 13, 14 and 61. Also
would like to meet with
department heads to discuss
cost savings on paper based
on gty and usage for line
items 28-55, and #65 and
help save postage if possible
by helping them plan the
projects keeping in mind
paper, print and mail
thresholds and help reduce
costs.

ordering built to your needs
free of charge




