2019-5-55 Expanded Personal Protective Equipment for Fire

Bid Tabulation by Supplier

CITY OF ALLEN

PURCHASING DIVISION

Casco Industries, Inc.

Delta Industrial Service & Supply

Price per Set| $3,621.89 Price per Set $1,766.00
Line#  Description Mfgr Mfgno QTY UOM Unit Extended Unit Extended
1 Globe G-XTREME 3.0 Jacket 1 EA $1,432.00  $1,432.00 No Bid
1ALT1 Globe Guard Exposure Resistance System 1 EA $105.11 $105.11
2 Cost per letter for hanging name tab on jacket 1 EA $3.00 $3.00 No Bid
3 Globe G-XTREME 3.0 Pants 1 EA $1,118.00 $1,118.00 No Bid
3 ALT1 Globe Guard Exposure Resistance System 1 EA $68.78 $68.78
4 Supreme Structural Fire Fighting 14 Pull-On Boots 1 EA $399.00 $399.00 No Bid
Cairns 1044 Traditional Fire Helmet with Integral Face
304.00 i
5 G 1 . $ $304.00 No Bid
6 Pro-Tech 8 Titan Pro Gloves 1 EA $79.00 $79.00
6 ALT1 :Vanguard, MK-1 Gloves Vanguard MK-1 1 EA $72.00
7 NFPA Compliant Particulate Barrier Hood PGI 3979471 1 EA $84.00 $84.00
Ques}, Par‘tlculate Barrleir Hood, Nomfex/Lenzmg Black BARRIER 22.80
7 ALT1 :Outside with Gray Stedair Prevent Inside Quest INHIBITOR 18 1 EA EEPAED
3048085
8 NFPA Traditional Hood PGI (Nomex) 1 EA $29.00 $29.00
8 ALT1 éMajestic , 100% Nomex, PAC I, White Majestic 100% PAC 2 1 EA $25.00
3049298 $29.00 $29.00
8 ALT2 PGI 3049298 (Carbon) PGI (Carbon) 1 EA : :
Additional di t t offered on PPE it t
|. |.ona iscount percent offered on items no 35% 0%
9 specified above 1 EA
Delivery Time (in days) after receipt of order of PPE
10 Order 1 EA 30-45 days 30 Days
11 Covert Armor F1 Fire Carrier 1 EA No Bid $251.00 $251.00
Covert Armor F1 Universal Fire Carrier Upgrade with )
12 Front and Back Molle Panels 1 EA No Bid 46.00 546.00
Covert Armor sa3100 Level IlIA NIJ 0101.06 Certified X
13 Ballistic Armor Panels for F1 Fire Carrier 1 EA No Bid 525.00 SEZETD
AR1000 Rhino eXtreme Spall Coated Rifle Armor, Level
111+ Stand Alone NIJ 0101.06 Certified, DEA Compliant No Bid $334.00 $334.00
14 (10x12SC) 1 EA
15 4" x 11" Nylon ID Panel (for Fire Department) 1 EA No Bid 36.00 $36.00
H1 ACH, Ballistic Helmet, Standard Cut, Level IlIA NIJ .
16 0106.01 1 EA No Bid 419.00 $419.00
17  Covert Armor Universal Radio Pouch 1 EA No Bid $63.00 $63.00
18  Covert Armor FCB Armor Carrying Bag 1 EA No Bid 92.00 $92.00
f’\ddltlonal dlsc'o.unt percent offered on Body Armor No Bid 5%
19  items not specified above 1 EA
20  Delivery (in days) after receipt of order 1 EA No Bid 60 Days

ALL BIDS SUBMITTED FOR THE DESIGNATED PROJECT ARE REFLECTED ON THIS BID TAB SHEET. HOWEVER, THE LISTING OF A BID ON THIS SHEET SHOULD NOT BE CONSTRUED AS
A COMMENT ON THE RESPONSIVENESS OF SUCH A BID OR AS ANY INDICATION THAT THE CITY ACCEPTS SUCH BID AS RESPONSIVE.

THE CITY WILL MAKE A DETERMINATION AS TO THE RESPONSIVENESS OF BIDS SUBMITTED BASED UPON COMPLIANCE WITH ALL APPLICABLE LAWS, CITY OF ALLEN PURCHASING
GUIDELINES, AND PROJECT DOCUMENTS INCLUDING BUT NOT LIMITED TO THE PROJECT SPECIFICATIONS AND CONTACT DOCUMENTS. THE CITY WILL NOTIFY THE SUCCESSFUL
BIDDER UPON AWARD OF THE CONTACT AND ACCORDING TO LAW, ALL BIDS RECEIVED WILL BE AVAILABLE FOR INSPECTION AT THAT TIME.
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