
Pricing Tabluation for Evaluated Proposals Only
RFP 2019‐11‐8 Direct Purhcase of Uniforms, Custom Apparel and Footwear

Category A: Uniform Polos, Woven Tops, Pants, and Miscallaneous Apparel

Vendor

EcoImprint 
LLC

AdWear
Customer 
Direct

Legacy 
Sports

All Star 
Custom 
Apparel

Galls LLC

Shipping/Setup 
Structure

City Pay for 
Shipping

Fee of  $75 
for orders 
of $150 or 

less

setup/artwo
rk fees 

included in 
price

Bid Spec‐ 
shipping 
included

Alt Spec‐ 
shipping 
included

Item Number Item Description Size 1
AB12 Red Kap® No-Scratch Leather Belt S-XL 17.49$       16.49$          $16.40 no bid $15.25 12.74$        
C833 Port Authority® Pro Mesh Cap OSFM 3.52$            3.49$         4.78$            $3.99 no bid $10.00 4.76$          
CP79 Port & Company® - Washed Twill Sandwich Bill Cap One Size 2.93$            2.89$         3.98$            $3.49 no bid $3.99
CP85 Port & Company® - Sandwich Bill Cap One Size 2.34$            2.33$         3.16$            $2.99 no bid $3.15 3.45$          
CP90 Port & Company® - Knit Cap One Size 1.75$            1.73$         2.38$            $2.79 no bid $3.99 5.45$          

CS402P CornerStone® - Industrial Pocket Pique Polo S-XL 12.93$          12.89$       17.58$          $11.99 no bid $18.99 no bid no bid
CS410 CornerStone® Select Snag-Proof Tactical Polo XS-XL 18.81$          12.89$       25.58$          $16.99 no bid $25.80

CS410LS CornerStone® - Select Long Sleeve Snag-Proof Tactical Polo XS-XL 22.34$          22.29$       30.38$          $19.99 no bid $30.65 17.31$        
CS411 CornerStone® Ladies Select Snag-Proof Tactical Polo XS-XL 18.81$          18.77$       25.58$          $16.99 no bid $25.80 29.18$        
CS802 CornerStone® - ANSI 107 Safety Cap One Size 5.87$            5.83$         7.98$            $5.99 no bid no bid
TLS508 Port Authority® Tall Short Sleeve Easy Care Shirt LT-XLT 14.11$          14.07$       19.18$          $12.99 no bid $24.79

HCF Port Authority® Outback Hat One Size 6.76$            6.73$         9.20$            $6.75 no bid $11.50
K469 Sport-Tek® Dri-Mesh® Polo XS-XL 12.93$          12.87$       17.58$          $11.99 no bid $17.59 13.81$        
K500 Port Authority® Silk Touch™ Polo - No Pocket XS-XL 8.81$            8.03$         11.98$          $8.49 no bid $12.10 16.67$         16.83$        

K500LS Port Authority® Silk Touch™ Long Sleeve Polo - no pocket XS-XL 12.93$          12.87$       17.58$          $11.99 no bid $22.39 24.46$         15.48$        
K500P Port Authority® Silk Touch™ Polo with Pocket XS-XL 10.58$          10.51$       14.38$          $9.99 no bid $14.39 14.05$        
K8000 Port Authority® EZCotton™ Polo Short Sleeve XS-XL 12.93$          12.97$       17.58$          $11.99 no bid $17.59 17.86$        

K8000LS Port Authority® EZCotton™ Polo Long Sleeve XS-XL 15.28$          15.23$       20.78$          $13.99 no bid $25.98 30.87$        
L474 Sport-Tek® Ladies Dri-Mesh® Pro Polo XS-XL 15.28$          8.88$         20.78$          $13.99 no bid $28.79 13.81$        
L500 Port Authority® Ladies Silk Touch™ Polo XS-XL 8.11$            12.87$       12.78$          $8.79 no bid $12.10 16.67$         13.81$        

Servicewear



Vendor

EcoImprint 
LLC

AdWear
Customer 
Direct

Legacy 
Sports

All Star 
Custom 
Apparel

Galls LLC

Shipping/Setup 
Structure

City Pay for 
Shipping

Fee of  $75 
for orders 
of $150 or 

less

setup/artwo
rk fees 

included in 
price

Bid Spec‐ 
shipping 
included

Alt Spec‐ 
shipping 
included

Servicewear

L508 Port Authority® Ladies Short Sleeve Easy Care  Shirt XS-XL 12.93$          12.87$       17.58$          $11.99 no bid $24.79 24.47$         18.04$        
L608 Port Authority® Ladies Long Sleeve Easy Care Shirt XS-XL 14.11$          14.03$       19.18$          $12.99 no bid $18.39 24.47$         19.71$        
L612 Port Authority® Ladies 3/4-Sleeve Easy Care Shirt XS-XL 12.93$          12.87$       17.58$          $11.99 no bid $23.99 24.47$        

LST650 Sport-Tek® Ladies Micro pique Sport-Wick® Polo XS-XL 12.93$          12.87$       17.58$          $12.99 no bid $17.73
NE1020 New Era® - Stretch Mesh Cap S/M, M/L, L/XL 6.81$            6.77$         9.26$            $6.79 no bid $11.19 8.94$          
NE302 New Era® - Youth Stretch Mesh Cap T/C, C/Y 6.81$            6.77$         9.29$            $6.79 no bid $9.26
PT20 Red Kap Men's Dura-Kap® Industrial Pant st (28-36, 38-42 E 14.96$          20.43$       19.98$          $15.99 no bid $16.79 14.40$        
PT32 Red Kap Men's Pleated Work Pant st (28-34, 36-42 Even) 19.27$       19.98$           No Bid  no bid $22.39 19.04$        
PT66 Red Kap Men's Cargo Short Waist (30-42 Even 16.46$          19.01$       22.38$          $17.49 no bid $22.39 17.02$        
PT88 Red Kap Men's Industrial Cargo Pant Waist (30-42 Even 19.42$          25.67$       26.38$          $19.99 no bid $26.39 20.35$        
S508 Port Authority® Short Sleeve Easy Care Shirt XS-XL 12.87$       17.58$          $11.99 no bid $19.99 24.47$         18.04$        
S608 Port Authority® Long Sleeve Easy Care Shirt XS-XL 14.11$          14.03$       19.18$          $12.99 no bid $18.39 24.47$         19.71$        

ST650 Sport-Tek® Micro pique Sport-Wick® Polo XS-XL 12.93$          12..87 17.58$          $11.99 no bid $17.73 15.83$        
ST655 Sport-Tek® Side Blocked Micro pique Sport-Wick® Polo XS-XL 13.52$          13.47$       17.58$          $12.49 no bid $17.99 15.83$        
ST657 Sport-Tek® Long Sleeve Micro pique Sport-Wick® Polo XS-XL 15.28$          15.23$       18.38$          $13.99 no bid $21.00 29.80$         15.48$        
ST700 Sport-Tek® Ultimate Performance Crew XS-XL 7.93$            7.61$         20.78$          $7.49 no bid $10.39
T474 Sport-Tek® Dri-Mesh® Pro Polo XS-XL 15.28$          15.23$       10.38$          $13.99 no bid $28.79

511‐73287 5.11 Tactlite Pro Short  No Bid 54.03$       20.78$           No Bid no bid $42.10
511‐73308 5.11 Taclite pro Short 11" Inseam  No Bid 57.03$        No Bid  No Bid no bid $43.36
511‐74273 5.11 Taclie Pro Pants Men's  No Bid 41.07$        No Bid  No Bid no bid $43.52
511‐64360 5.11 Taclite Pro Pant Women's  No Bid 43.07$        No Bid  No Bid no bid $43.52
ST350 Sport‐Tek Competitor Tee XS‐XL 4.69$              4.67$           3.38$              $4.99 no bid $6.45

ITEM TYPE DESCRIPTION
ITEM # or Equal 
to or Better



Vendor

EcoImprint 
LLC

AdWear
Customer 
Direct

Legacy 
Sports

All Star 
Custom 
Apparel

Galls LLC

Shipping/Setup 
Structure

City Pay for 
Shipping

Fee of  $75 
for orders 
of $150 or 

less

setup/artwo
rk fees 

included in 
price

Bid Spec‐ 
shipping 
included

Alt Spec‐ 
shipping 
included

Servicewear

Monterey Club 
Polo Short Sleeve 

Shirt

Monterey Club Micro pique Sport Wick Polo 96% Cotton/4% 
Spandex, white, black, navy, royal blue, red.  Embroidered 

Logo 1060‐870 no bid 29.11$         ALT 11.18  No Bid  no bid  No Bid  

Oxford 
Van Heusen Wrinkle Free:  white, cyan, English blue, khaki 

light blue, dark green

Men VH 56850 
and Women VH 

59850 no bid 19.73$         ALT 17.58  No Bid  no bid $19.19

Oxford 
Van Heusen Wrinkle Free:  L/S: white cyan, English blue, 

khaki, light blue, dark green

Men VH 56800 
and Women‐H 

59800 no bid 25.73$         ALT 19.18  No Bid  no bid  No Bid  

Hooded Jacket
Devon and Jones 3 Season all weather sport parka hooded 

jacket mid‐weight D735 no bid 34.11$         ALT 19.98  No Bid  no bid $39.99
Summer Hat Black/Khaki Cap WM‐6 no bid 3.03$           ALT 3.66  No Bid  no bid $21.00

Polo LNX Performance Polo ‐ Red/Royal 1577 no bid ALT 15.98  No Bid  no bid $17.59
Oxford  LNX Easy Care Oxford ‐ French Blue 1077 no bid ALT 22.39  No Bid  no bid $16.50
Cardigan LNX Zippered Cardigan ‐ Navy 372 no bid ALT 35.18  No Bid  no bid $51.99

Soft Touch Sleeve 
Poplin

LNXSoft Touch 3/4 Sleeve Poplin ‐Short Sleeve, Long Sleeve 
in Red/Royal, Black/White/Gray 5040 no bid ALT 15.58  No Bid  no bid  No Bid  

Apron LNX Bistro Apron ‐ Black 9007 no bid ALT 7.98  No Bid  no bid $10.94
Cap LNX New Era mesh cap ‐Black NE302 no bid 6.77$           9.16$              $9.29 no bid $10.39
Jacket LNX Challenger Jacket‐ Black J353 no bid 46.38$             No Bid  no bid $41.59

Sports Tek Side 
Block Polo

LNX Sports Tek Side Block Polo Black/Red, Red/White, Blue 
Gold ST655 no bid 13.47$         18.38$            $12.49 no bid $18.39

Customization Price



Vendor

EcoImprint 
LLC

AdWear
Customer 
Direct

Legacy 
Sports

All Star 
Custom 
Apparel

Galls LLC

Shipping/Setup 
Structure

City Pay for 
Shipping

Fee of  $75 
for orders 
of $150 or 

less

setup/artwo
rk fees 

included in 
price

Bid Spec‐ 
shipping 
included

Alt Spec‐ 
shipping 
included

Servicewear

Embroidery of Logo   $          5.00  5.50$              2.96$           no bid 11.00$         5.25$           5.25$          
Screen Print of Logo  $          1.50  see print list 1.47$           no bid 10.00$        
Embroidery of Name  $          4.00  2.50$              1.97$           no bid 8.00$           3.68$           3.68$          

Cateogy C: Outerwear
The form is suggested sample format, other proposal formats are accepted. 

Item Number Item Description Size 1
BERNE® Flex180™ Chore Coat M‐XL 47.97$         71.98$            No Bid no bid No Bid  52.85$        

BERNE® Hooded Duck Jacket M-XL 37.11$       54.38$            No Bid no bid No Bid  48.03$        
BERNE® Hooded Duck Jacket Tall Sleeve MT-XLT 36.59$       57.58$            No Bid no bid No Bid  no bid

JD20 Blended Duck Zip-Front Hooded Jacket Reg (S-XL) 54.67$       79.99$          59.96$       no bid 60.79$         no bid
J130 Carhartt® Sandstone Duck Active Hooded Jacket S-XL 81.11$       77.98$          65.99$       no bid 87.69$         no bid

CSJ25 CornerStone® - ANSI 107 Class 3 Safety Windbreaker S-XL 31.75$          31.71$       43.18$          27.99$       no bid 47.99$         83.76$        
J763H CornerStone® Duck Cloth Hooded Work Jacket XS-XL 39.89$       54.38$          34.99$       no bid 68.79$         no bid
J763 CornerStone® Duck Cloth Work Jacket XS-XL 39.99$          34.59$       51.18$          32.99$       no bid 62.39$         48.03$        

TLJ763 CornerStone® Duck Cloth Work Jacket - Tall LT-XLT 39.99$          39.89$       54.38$          34.99$       no bid No Bid  no bid
TB839 Dickies® Duck Insulated Bib Overalls M-XL 68.73$       68.99$          No Bid no bid 58.50$         no bid
TJ718 Dickies® Hooded Duck Jacket M-XL 68.67$       61.99$          No Bid no bid 52.92$         no bid
TV239 Dickies® Insulated Duck Coveralls M-XL 78.49$       79.99$          No Bid no bid 66.78$         no bid
33237 Dickies® Nylon Hooded Fleece Lined Jacket S-XL 26.15$       29.99$          No Bid no bid 25.64$         no bid
J799 Port Authority Heavyweight Parks XS-XL 82.34$          82.11$       111.98$        70.99$       no bid No Bid  79.81$        
L232 Port Authority Ladies Fleece Sweater XS-XL 27.05$            29.99$       36.78$            23.99$       no bid 36.79$         no bid
F232 Port Authority Men's Fleece Sweater XS-XL 27.05$            29.99$       36.78$            23.99$       no bid 32.84$         no bid
J777 Port Authority® 3-in-1 Jacket XS-XL 57.64$          57.57$       78.39$          49.99$       no bid 68.55$         124.14$      

J799S Port Authority® ANSI 107 Class 3 Safety Heavyweight Parka XS-XL 94.11$          93.91$       127.98$        80.99$       no bid No Bid  135.11$      
J754 Port Authority® Challenger™ Jacket XS-XL 30.58$          30.43$       41.58$          26.99$       no bid 41.59$         57.81$        



Vendor

EcoImprint 
LLC

AdWear
Customer 
Direct

Legacy 
Sports

All Star 
Custom 
Apparel

Galls LLC

Shipping/Setup 
Structure

City Pay for 
Shipping

Fee of  $75 
for orders 
of $150 or 

less

setup/artwo
rk fees 

included in 
price

Bid Spec‐ 
shipping 
included

Alt Spec‐ 
shipping 
included

Servicewear

TJ754 Port Authority® Challenger™ Jacket Tall LT-XLT 32.93$          32.81$       44.78$          28.99$       no bid No Bid  no bid
J318 Port Authority® Core Colorblock Soft Shell Jacket XS-XL 29.40$          29.23$       39.98$          25.99$       no bid 39.99$         53.51$        
J327 Port Authority® Hooded Charger Jacket XS-XL 29.40$          29.29$       39.98$          25.99$       no bid No Bid  no bid
L354 Port Authority® Ladies Challenger™ Jacket XS-XL 32.93$          32.81$       44.78$          28.99$       no bid No Bid  no bid
L318 Port Authority® Ladies Core Colorblock Soft Shell Jacket XS-XL 29.40$          29.23$       39.98$          25.99$       no bid 49.98$         53.51$        
L217 Port Authority® Ladies Value Fleece Jacket XS-XL 16.46$          16.23$       22.38$          14.99$       no bid 22.39$         no bid
J706 Port Authority® Textured Hooded Soft Shell Jacket XS-XL 41.16$          41.11$       55.98$          35.99$       no bid 63.99$         no bid
F218 Port Authority® Value Fleece 1/4-Zip Pullover XS-XL 15.28$          15.19$       20.76$          13.99$       no bid 20.79$         35.05$        
F217 Port Authority® Value Fleece Jacket XS-XL 16.46$          16.31$       22.36$          14.99$       no bid 22.39$         no bid
J342 Port Authority® Zephyr V-Neck Pullover Windbreaker XS-XL 9.40$            9.33$         12.87$          8.99$         no bid 15.98$         26.76$        
RH55 Red House® - Ladies Sweater Fleece Full-Zip Jacket XS-XL 28.17$       48.00$          25.00$       no bid 48.00$         38.97$        
RH54 Red House® - Sweater Fleece Full-Zip Jacket XS-XL 28.17$       48.00$          25.00$       no bid No Bid  38.97$        
BD30 Red Kap® Insulated Blended Duck Bib Overall S-Xl 89.11$       97.99$          100.44$     no bid 103.19$       81.95$        
JP70 Red Kap® Men's Heavyweight Parka S-XL  $       74.50 102.99$        95.74$       no bid 100.79$       79.81$        
JT38 Red Kap® Men's Perma-Lined Solid Team Jacket Reg (S-XL)  $       29.77 41.59$          35.44$       no bid 32.79$         29.04$        

Weatherproof Soft Shell Jacket M‐XL 23.49$         41.98$            70.99$         no bid 35.99$        

Customization Price
Embroidery of Logo  5.00$           5.50$              $2.96 no bid 11.00$         5.25$          
Screen Print of Logo 1.50$           see list $1.47 no bid 10.00$        
Embroidery of Name 4.00$           2.50$              $1.97 no bid 8.00$           3.68$          

Section B: Screen Print and Custom Tees
Charts hsowing tiered pricing based on incremental quantities are accepted. The form is suggested sample format, other proposal formats are accepted. 



Vendor

EcoImprint 
LLC

AdWear
Customer 
Direct

Legacy 
Sports

All Star 
Custom 
Apparel

Galls LLC

Shipping/Setup 
Structure

City Pay for 
Shipping

Fee of  $75 
for orders 
of $150 or 

less

setup/artwo
rk fees 

included in 
price

Bid Spec‐ 
shipping 
included

Alt Spec‐ 
shipping 
included

Servicewear

Color Screen Print Custom Tees (Promotional) Standard Sizing

1 side, up to 
30, bigger 
discount for 
larger qty 1‐30 pcs

add $0.95‐
$4.90 print 
fee per shirt 1‐30 pcs 1‐30 pcs

White
100 PRE‐SHRUNK COTTON ADULT  T‐SHIRT PRICING FOR ONE 

SIDE PRINT FRONT OR BACK XS‐XL 4.58$              2.89$           2.66$              3.48$           3.92$           7.46$           no bid no bid

Color
100 PRE‐SHRUNK COTTON ADULT  T‐SHIRT PRICING FOR ONE 

SIDE PRINT FRONT OR BACK XS‐XL 4.96$              2.89$           4.14$              3.77$           6.04$           7.46$           no bid no bid

White
100 PRE‐SHRUNK COTTON YOUTH  T‐SHIRT PRICING FOR 

ONE SIDE PRINT FRONT OR BACK XS‐XL 4.22$              2.89$           2.19$              3.24$           3.30$           no bid no bid

Color
100 PRE‐SHRUNK COTTON YOUTH  T‐SHIRT PRICING FOR 

ONE SIDE PRINT FRONT OR BACK XS‐XL 5.13$              2.89$           3.52$              3.65$           5.58$           no bid no bid

White
50/50 BLEND ADULT T‐SHIRT PRICING FOR ONE SIDE PRINT 

FRONT OR BACK XS‐XL 4.58$              2.93$           1.84$              3.57$           3.88$           8.29$           no bid no bid

Color
50/50 BLEND ADULT T‐SHIRT PRICING FOR ONE SIDE PRINT 

FRONT OR BACK XS‐XL 4.96$              2.93$           2.94$              3.84$           5.68$           8.29$           no bid no bid

White
50/50 BLEND YOUTH T‐SHIRT PRICING FOR ONE SIDE PRINT 

FRONT OR BACK XS‐XL 4.25$              2.93$           2.50$              3.28$           3.24$           no bid no bid

Color
50/50 BLEND YOUTH T‐SHIRT PRICING FOR ONE SIDE PRINT 

FRONT OR BACK XS‐XL 5.13$              2.93$           4.00$              3.65$           4.16$           no bid no bid
Screen Setup $15 setup $15 ea

Item Number Unform Tees Size 1 Price 
5180 Hanes® Beefy-T® - Born To Be Worn 100% Cotton T-Shirt XS-XL 3.79$            3.59$         6.91$            $4.22 8.64$           7.95$           6.96$          
5186 Hanes® Beefy-T® -  100% Cotton Long Sleeve T-Shirt S-XL 7.66$            7.67$         10.42$          $7.51 13.03$         8.79$           13.91$        



Vendor

EcoImprint 
LLC

AdWear
Customer 
Direct

Legacy 
Sports

All Star 
Custom 
Apparel

Galls LLC

Shipping/Setup 
Structure

City Pay for 
Shipping

Fee of  $75 
for orders 
of $150 or 

less

setup/artwo
rk fees 

included in 
price

Bid Spec‐ 
shipping 
included

Alt Spec‐ 
shipping 
included

Servicewear

5190 Hanes® Beefy-T® - 100% Cotton T-Shirt with Pocket S-XL 6.46$            4.99$         8.87$            $6.49 10.98$         8.78$           6.95$          
5280 Hanes® - ComfortSoft® Heavyweight 100%  Cotton T-Shirt XS-XL 2.29$            2.01$         4.27$            $2.91 5.34$           5.59$           6.96$          
PC61 Port & Company® - Essential T-Shirt S-XL 2.34$            2.21$         4.90$            $2.93 6.13$           5.59$           6.95$          

PC61LS Port & Company® - Long Sleeve Essential T-Shirt S-XL 4.82$            4.43$         9.07$            $4.83 11.34$         9.59$          
PC61LSPT ort & Company® Tall Long Sleeve Essential T- Shirt With Pock LT-XLT 7.49$            7.79$         10.19$          $7.73 13.46$         12.79$         16.37$        

PC61P Port & Company® - Essential T-Shirt with Pocket S-XL 5.29$            5.17$         7.20$            $5.50 9.00$           9.59$           10.58$        
PC61PT Port & Company® Tall Essential T-Shirt With Pocket LT-XLT 6.12$            6.01$         8.32$            $6.20 10.40$         10.39$        
PC61T Port & Company® - Tall Essential T-Shirt LT-XLT 5.41$            5.31$         7.36$            $5.60 9.20$           7.99$          

Customization Price Price
Embroidery of Logo  7.06$              5.00$           5.50$              $2.96 5.00$           11.00$         5.25$          
Screen Print of Logo 1.50$           see list $1.47 2.50$           10.00$        
Embroidery of Name 4.71$              4.00$           2.50$              $1.97 1.00$           8.00$           3.68$          

Category D: Footwear

Work Wear 
Safety Shoes

Cavender's

30% 10%Discount off of list price


