BID TABULATION FOR BID #2018-12-11
JOE FARMER RECREATION CENTER BRIDGE
OPENED: JANUARY 11, 2018

CITY OF ALLEN
WILLIAMS
MART, INC. & FROST NORTH ROCK
GENERAL CONSTRUCTION, | IWC TEXASLLC | GHB EQUIPMENT
CONTRACTORS SPECIALTY LLC
GROUP LLC
Item Description S:; UuoM AMOUNT AMOUNT AMOUNT AMOUNT AMOUNT
Base Bid
1 |Mobilization 1 LS | $ 24,400.00 | $ 40,000.00 | $ 22,798.19 | $ 16,310.00 NO BID
2 |Bonds 1 LS | $ 16,500.00 | $ 13,59291 ( $ 13,560.00 | $ 1.00 NO BID
3 |Insurance 1 LS |'$ 29,300.00 | $ 2353750 | $ 3,390.00 | $ 16,310.00 NO BID
4 [Clearning/Grubbing 1 LS $ 1,500.00 | $ 6,275.46 | $ 1,631.00 NO BID
5 [Topsoil 1 LS |'$ 25,600.00 | $ 1,500.00 | $ 2,260.00 | $ 2,175.00 NO BID
6 |Sodding 1 LS |'$ 29,300.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 16,476.41 | $ 5,437.00 NO BID
Preservation &
7 Protection of Plants 1 LS $ 2,500.00 | $ 4,030.98 | $ 2,175.00 NO BID
8 gflr(‘j‘ge’ Existing North 1| s |s 39,00000 | $  16,500.00 | $ 2757145 | $ 27,183.00 NO BID
9 gflr(‘;;’e’ Existing South 1 | s |s 2400000 | $ 1350000 | $ 16,232.04 | $ 10,873.00 NO BID
Demo/Existing North
10 Covered Area/Walkway 1 LS | $ 5,000.00 | $ 6,500.00 | $ 14,367.54 | $ 10,873.00 NO BID
North Fed Bridge
11 |Piers & Abutments 1 LS |'$ 172,500.00 | $  42,000.00 | $ 60,620.50 | $ 163,098.00 NO BID
Precast Concrete
12 |PermaTrak Boardwalk 1 LS | $ 180,000.00 [ $  51,000.00 | $ 75,409.94 | $ 240,211.00 NO BID
Deck
Precast Prestressed
13 |PermaTrak Concrete 1 LS | $ - $ 80,000.00 | $ 110,302.08 NO BID
Beams
14 |Structural Steel-Railing 1 LS | $ 73,500.00 [ $  32,000.00 | $ 25,781.39 | $ 16,310.00 NO BID
15 |Light Poles 1 LS | $ 28,000.00 [ $ 12,500.00 | $ 54,240.00 | $ 86,980.00
South Fed Bridge NO BID
16 |Piers & Abutments 1 LS | $ 70,500.00 | $ 28,000.00 | $ 4236957 | $ 54,366.00 NO BID
Precast Concrete
17 |PermaTrak Boardwalk 1 LS | $ 80,000.00 | $ 35,000.00 | $ 40,483.10 | $ 91,509.00 NO BID
Deck
Precast Prestressed
18 |PermaTrak Concrete 1 LS | $ - $  47,000.00 | $ 56,970.93 NO BID
Beams
19 |[Structural Steel-Railing 1 Ls | $ 36,600.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 12,217.37 | $ 9,242.00
20]Light Poles 1 LS | $ 13,400.00 | $ 10,500.00 | $ 36,160.00 | $ 43,493.00 NO BID
North Covered Area NO BID




WILLIAMS

MART, INC. & FROST NORTH ROCK
GENERAL CONSTRUCTION, ] IWC TEXASLLC | GHB EQUIPMENT
CONTRACTORS SPECIALTY LLC
GROUP LLC
Item Description S:; UuoM AMOUNT AMOUNT AMOUNT AMOUNT AMOUNT
Masonry
Replacement/Repair 1 LS | $ 9,800.00 | $ 4,750.00 | $ 7,910.00 | $ 32,620.00 NO BID
Precast Concrete
22 PermaTrak Boardwalk 1 LS | $ - $ 10,000.00 | $ 40,035.62 | $ 5,437.00 NO BID
Deck
Miscellaneous Steel
23 Angles 1 LS | $ - $ 3,500.00 | $ 11,300.00 | $ 8,155.00 NO BID
24 Structural Steel-Railing 1 LS | $ - $ 5,000.00 | $ 13,332.58 | $ 2,718.00 NO BID
TOTAL BASE BID $ 857,400.00 | $ 507,880.41 | $ 714,095.15 | $ 847,107.00
DAYS TO COMPLETE
WORK 180 130 150 180
Add Alternate 1 -Precast Concrete Slabs
1 |Mobilization 1 LS NO BID $ 40,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
2 |Bonds 1 LS NO BID $ 12,643.13 NO BID NO BID NO BID
3 |Insurance 1 LS NO BID $ 22,987.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID
4 |Clearning/Grubbing 1 LS NO BID $ 1,500.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
5 |Topsoil 1 LS NO BID $ 1,500.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
6 |Sodding 1 LS NO BID $ 2,500.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Preservation &
7 . 1 LS NO BID $ 2,500.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Protection of Plants
8 EZZ"SE/EX'S“”Q North 1 | Ls NO BID $  16500.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
9 EZZ"SE/EX'S“”Q South 1 | Ls NO BID $  13500.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Demo/Existing North
10| Covered Area/Walkway ! LS NO BID $ 6.500.00 NOBID NO BID NO BID
North Fed Bridge
11 [Piers & Abutments 1 LS NO BID $ 42,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
12 Precast Concrete Slab 1 Ls NO BID $ 125,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Beams
13 |Structural Steel-Railing 1 LS NO BID $ 32,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
15 [Light Poles 1 LS NO BID $ 12,500.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
South Fed Bridge
16 |[Piers & Abutments 1 LS NO BID $ 28,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
17 |Precast Concrete Slab 1| Ls NO BID $ 75,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Beams




WILLIAMS

MART, INC. & FROST NORTH ROCK
GENERAL CONSTRUCTION, ] IWC TEXASLLC | GHB EQUIPMENT
CONTRACTORS SPECIALTY LLC
GROUP LLC
Item Description S:; UuoM AMOUNT AMOUNT AMOUNT AMOUNT AMOUNT
19 |Structural Steel-Railing 1 LS NO BID $ 25,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
20|Light Poles 1 LS NO BID $ 12,500.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
North Covered Area
Masonry . 1 | Ls NO BID $ 4,750.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Replacement/Repair
Precast Concrete
22 PermaTrak Boardwalk 1 LS NO BID $ 10,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Deck
Miscellaneous Steel 1 LS NO BID $ 3,500.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Angles
24 Structural Steel-Railing 1 LS NO BID $ 5,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
TOTAL ALT. 1BID: NO BID $ 495,380.63 NO BID NO BID NO BID
DAYS TO COMPLETE
WORK 160 0 0
Add Alternate 2 - Non-Prestressed Beam
1 |Mobilization 1 LS $24,400.00 $40,000.00 $22,798.19 $ 50,000.00
2 |Bonds 1 LS $16,500.00 $11,900.63 $13,560.00 $ 7,000.00
3 |Insurance 1 LS $29,300.00 $21,637.50 $3,390.00 $ 5,000.00
4 |Clearning/Grubbing 1 LS $1,500.00 $7,501.51 $ 20,000.00
5 |Topsoil 1 LS $25,600.00 $1,500.00 $2,260.00 $ 1,000.00
6 |Sodding 1 LS $29,300.00 $2,500.00 $16,476.41 $ 2,000.00
7 [Preservation & 1| Ls $2,500.00 $4,030.98 $ 1,000.00
Protection of Plants
8 SZZ‘; Existing North 1 | s $39,000.00 $16,500.00 $27,571.45 $ 110,000.00
9 gfl';‘;é Existing South 1 | Ls $24,000.00 $13,500.00 $16,232.04 $ 20,000.00
Demo/Existing North
10| Covered Area/Walkway ! LS $5,000.00 $6,500.00 $14,367.54 $ 6,000.00
North Fed Bridge
11 |Piers & Abutments 1 LS $172,500.00 $42,000.00 $60,620.50 $ 90,000.00
Precast Concrete
12 |PermaTrack Boardwalk 1 LS $150,000.00 $51,000.00 $75,409.94 -$40,000.00 $ 125,000.00
Precast Non-Prestressed
13 |PermaTrak Concrete $55,000.00 $80,483.64 $ 50,000.00

Reamg




WILLIAMS

MART, INC. & FROST NORTH ROCK
GENERAL CONSTRUCTION, ] IWC TEXASLLC | GHB EQUIPMENT
CONTRACTORS SPECIALTY LLC
GROUP LLC
Item Description S:; UuoMm AMOUNT AMOUNT AMOUNT AMOUNT AMOUNT
13 [Structural Steel-Railing 1 LS $73,500.00 $32,000.00 $25,781.39 $ 14,000.00
15 |Light Poles 1 LS $28,000.00 $12,500.00 $54,240.00 $ 12,000.00
South Fed Bridge
16 |[Piers & Abutments 1 LS $70,500.00 $28,000.00 $42,369.57 $ 30,000.00
Precast Concrete
17 |PermaTrak Boardwalk 1 LS $60,000.00 $35,000.00 $40,483.10 -$15,000.00 $ 15,000.00
Deck
Precast Non-Prestressed
PermaTrak Concrete $0.00 $32,000.00 $42,506.93 $ 25,000.00
Beams
19 [Structural Steel-Railing 1 LS $36,600.00 $25,000.00 $12,217.37 $ 10,000.00
20]Light Poles 1 LS $13,400.00 $12,500.00 $36,160.00 $ 7,000.00
North Covered Area
21| Masonry . 1 | s $9,80000|  $4,750.00 $7,910.00 $ 3,000.00
Replacement/Repair
Precast Concrete
22|PermaTrak Boardwalk 1 LS $0.00 $10,000.00 $40,035.62 $ 6,000.00
Deck
23 Miscellaneous Steel 1 LS $0.00 $3,500.00 $11,300.00 $ 3,000.00
Angles
24(Structural Steel-Railing 1 LS $0.00 $5,000.00 $13,332.58 $ 2,000.00
TOTAL ALT. 2 BID: $807,400.00 $466,288.13 $671,038.76 $792,107.00 $614,000.00
DAYS TO COMPLETE
WORK 180 140 150 0 200
GRAND TOTAL W/
SELECTED ALTERNATES: $1,664,800.00 $974,168.54 $1,385,133.91 $1,639,214.00 $614,000.00
TOTAL DAYS 360 430 300 180 200




