
Name of Vendor Qty UOM  Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price  Unit Price Extended Price  Unit Price Extended Price  Unit Price Extended Price

1
 21-0-0 Granular, 50lb bag,  APF 

Ammonium Sulfate
1 Ton 340.00$        340.00$           NO BID NO BID 300.00$           300.00$           -$                 478.00$           478.00$           

2
 Hou-actinite Greens Grade (50 lb 

bag)
1 Ton 420.00$        420.00$           NO BID NO BID 416.00$           416.00$           -$                 540.00$           540.00$           

3
21-0-0 Sprayable 50lb bag, APF 

Ammonium Sulfate
0.50 Ton

387.60$        193.80$           NO BID NO BID 355.20$           177.60$           -$                 642.00$           321.00$           

4
13-0-45 Multi-K Sprayable, Haifa 

Multi K GG Brand, (50 lb. bag)
0.50 Ton 1,300.00$     650.00$           NO BID NO BID 1,172.80$       586.40$           -$                 -$                 

5 Andersons A-TEP (50 lb bag) 20 EA
54.00$           1,080.00$       NO BID NO BID 52.50$             1,050.00$       -$                 38.50$             770.00$           

6
Andersons 7-14-14 ContecDG 

(40lb bag)
20 EA

46.30$           926.00$           NO BID NO BID 48.50$             970.00$           -$                 55.50$             1,110.00$        

7
Andersons 12-3-12 ContecDG (40 

lb bag)
20 EA 46.40$           928.00$           NO BID NO BID 45.90$             918.00$           -$                 46.25$             925.00$           

8
Andersons Goose/Crab (28.8 lb 

bag)
20 EA 94.00$           1,880.00$       NO BID NO BID 89.77$             1,795.40$       -$                 123.95$           2,479.00$        

9
Princep (Simizine) 4L (2.5 

Gallons)
8 EA

49.07$           392.56$           NO BID NO BID 43.85$             350.80$           79.63$             637.04$           46.80$             374.40$           

10 Top Choice Fipronil (50 lb bag) 4 EA 137.50$        550.00$           NO BID NO BID 137.50$           550.00$           -$                 125.00$           500.00$           

11
Fiprnil .0143G Insecticide (30 lb 

bag)
6 EA 50.90$           305.40$           NO BID NO BID 46.69$             280.14$           50.05$             300.30$           -$                 

12
Strike 3 (3-Way) Broadleaf 

Herbicide, 2.5 Gals
8 EA

53.75$           430.00$           NO BID NO BID 66.96$             535.68$           84.50$             676.00$           58.50$             468.00$           

13 PBI Gordon Ferromec AC 30 Gal 11.00$           330.00$           NO BID NO BID 8.06$               241.80$           18.34$             550.20$           11.35$             340.50$           

14
Foliar Fertilizer 12-0-0 6%Fe, 

2:Mn, (2.5 gal)
10 EA 22.50$           225.00$           NO BID NO BID 28.51$             285.10$           107.50$           1,075.00$       40.00$             400.00$           

15 Revolution Wetting Agent (2.5 gal) 4 EA 259.38$        1,037.50$       NO BID NO BID 259.38$           1,037.52$       -$                 -$                 
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Name of Vendor Qty UOM  Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price  Unit Price Extended Price  Unit Price Extended Price  Unit Price Extended Price

16 Arena 50WDG (40 oz bottle) 1 EA 563.25$        563.25$           NO BID NO BID 563.25$           563.25$           -$                 563.25$           563.25$           

17 MSMA 6 Plus (2.5 gal) 20 EA 64.72$           1,294.40$       NO BID NO BID 66.96$             1,339.20$       105.63$           2,112.60$       74.94$             1,498.80$        

18 Iprodione Fungicide (2.5 gal) 10 EA 137.50$        1,375.00$       NO BID NO BID 102.27$           1,022.70$       143.00$           1,430.00$       107.50$           1,075.00$        

19 Prostar 70WP Fungicide, (3 lbs) 20 EA
178.62$        3,572.40$       NO BID NO BID 168.12$           3,362.40$       -$                 198.05$           3,961.00$        

20 Daconil Action Fungicide (2.5 gal) 15 EA 194.00$        2,910.00$       NO BID NO BID 194.00$           2,910.00$       -$                 194.00$           2,910.00$       

21
Daconil Weather Stik Fungicide 

(2.5 gal)
10 EA 152.50$        1,525.00$       NO BID NO BID 152.50$           1,525.00$       130.00$           1,300.00$       152.50$           1,525.00$        

22 Heritage Fungicide, 1 LB. 8 EA
317.00$        2,536.00$       NO BID NO BID 317.00$           2,536.00$       -$                 317.00$           2,536.00$        

23 Headway Fungicide, 1 GAL 4 EA 417.00$        1,668.00$       NO BID NO BID 417.00$           1,668.00$       -$                 417.00$           1,668.00$        

24 Bifenthrin Insecticide 1 GAL 8 EA 30.88$           247.04$           NO BID NO BID 30.49$             243.92$           44.20$             353.60$           38.50$             308.00$           

25
Lambda-cyhalothrin Insecticide 

9.7%, 1 QT.
8 EA

123.10$        984.80$           NO BID NO BID 131.96$           1,055.68$       62.40$             499.20$           -$                 

26 Certainty Herbicide, 1.25 ounces 12 EA
70.83$           849.90$           NO BID NO BID 76.89$             922.68$           102.70$           1,232.40$       86.65$             1,039.80$        

27 Revolver Herbicide, 1 QT. 8 EA 213.83$        1,710.64$       NO BID NO BID 216.77$           1,734.16$       -$                 259.58$           2,076.64$        

28 Celsius Herbicide (10 oz bottle) 10 EA 98.12$           981.20$           NO BID NO BID 98.12$             981.20$           -$                 98.12$             981.20$           

29 Affirm WDG Fungicide, 2.4 Lbs. 1 EA
222.96$        222.96$           NO BID NO BID 92.90$             92.90$             -$                 222.96$           222.96$           

30 Secure Fungicide, 2.5 Gallons 1 EA
1,470.00$     1,470.00$       NO BID NO BID 1,470.00$       1,470.00$       950.00$           950.00$           1,470.00$       1,470.00$        

31 26/36 Fungicide, 2.5 Gallons 10 EA 280.50$        2,805.00$       NO BID NO BID -$                 -$                 280.50$           2,805.00$        

32 Uflexx 46-0-0-Fertilizer, 50 lb bag 80 EA 22.44$           1,795.20$       NO BID NO BID 23.71$             1,896.80$       -$                 27.75$             2,220.00$        

33 Umaxx 47-0-0 Fertilizer, 50 lb bag 40 EA 28.85$           1,154.00$       NO BID NO BID 28.71$             1,148.40$       -$                 31.50$             1,260.00$        

34

28-3-10 Fertilizer with 50% 

PolySCU OR Nutrasphere 

Nitrogen, 4% Fe,  50 lb plastic bag

240 EA
15.86$           3,806.40$       NO BID NO BID 15.34$             3,681.60$       -$                 19.10$             4,584.00$        

35 BiomendDG 9-4-9, 40 lb bag 40 EA 43.50$           1,740.00$       NO BID NO BID 43.50$             1,740.00$       -$                 39.50$             1,580.00$        

36 Team 2G (40 lb bag) 20 EA 20.63$           412.60$           NO BID NO BID 18.85$             377.00$           -$                 -$                 



Name of Vendor Qty UOM  Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price  Unit Price Extended Price  Unit Price Extended Price  Unit Price Extended Price

37
Andersons 10-5-20 ContecDG 

(40lb bag)
20 EA 48.10$           962.00$           NO BID NO BID 47.60$             952.00$           -$                 52.50$             1,050.00$        

38
Andersons 18-24-5 ContecDG 

(40lb bag)
10 EA 37.20$           372.00$           NO BID NO BID -$                 -$                 -$                 

39
25-0-10 w/50%Uflex,2%Fe,2%Mg 

(50lb bag)
240 EA -$                 NO BID NO BID 13.76$             3,302.40$       -$                 19.50$             4,680.00$        

40
28-3-10 w/50%XCU, 5%Fe (50 lb 

bag)
240 EA

-$                 NO BID NO BID 15.34$             3,681.60$       -$                 19.10$             4,584.00$        

41
23-0-6 w/50% Nutrisphere-N 150 

SGN 50lb Bag
120 EA 18.67$           2,240.40$       NO BID NO BID 18.92$             2,270.40$       -$                 20.25$             2,430.00$        

42
18-0-5 w/.45% Barricade, 

30%SRN (50lb bag)
120 EA -$                 NO BID NO BID 14.50$             1,740.00$       -$                 21.95$             2,634.00$       

43
28-3-10 w/50%PolySRN, 3%Fe 

(50lb bag)
240 EA

-$                 NO BID NO BID 15.34$             3,681.60$       -$                 19.10$             4,584.00$        

44
24-2-12 w/55%SRN, 1%Fe, trace 

element pkg. (50 lb bag)
120 EA 16.00$           1,920.00$       NO BID NO BID 18.30$             2,196.00$       -$                 18.75$             2,250.00$        

45 Freehand 1.75 G (50 lb bag) 20 EA 93.50$           1,870.00$       NO BID NO BID 93.50$             1,870.00$       -$                 93.50$             1,870.00$        

46 Specticle Herbicide (1 gal) 3 EA
1,606.50$     4,819.50$       NO BID NO BID 1,606.50$       4,819.50$       -$                 1,606.50$       4,819.50$        

47 Oxadiazon Flo Herbicide (2.5 gal) 10 EA
300.00$        3,000.00$       NO BID NO BID 123.42$           1,234.20$       386.75$           3,867.50$       412.50$           4,125.00$        

48 Prodiamine 65 WDG Herbicide (lb) 100 EA 9.88$             988.00$           NO BID NO BID 8.89$               889.00$           13.00$             1,300.00$       48.95$             4,895.00$        

49 Subdue Maxx (1 gal) 2 EA 520.00$        1,040.00$       NO BID NO BID 520.00$           1,040.00$       436.84$           873.68$           520.00$           1,040.00$       

50 Velista Fungicide (22 oz bottle) 8 EA
204.60$        1,636.80$       NO BID NO BID 204.60$           1,636.80$       -$                 204.60$           1,636.80$        

51
Foliar Fertilizer 18-3-6 w/50%SRN 

(2.5 Gal)
4 EA

40.00$           160.00$           NO BID NO BID 40.43$             161.72$           -$                 55.00$             220.00$           

52
Fore80 Rainshield WSP (48 lb 

case)
2 EA 420.00$        840.00$           NO BID NO BID 377.84$           755.68$           -$                 452.24$           904.48$           

53
Calcium 8.25% Soil Remediation 

(2.5gal)
6 EA 85.73$           514.35$           NO BID NO BID 47.04$             282.24$           110.00$           660.00$           40.00$             240.00$           

54 Salt RX Soil Remediation (2.5 gal) 6 EA -$                 NO BID NO BID 93.32$             559.92$           -$                 95.00$             570.00$           

55
EArthMax Soil Remediation (2.5 

gal)
6 EA 101.50$        609.00$           NO BID NO BID 36.75$             220.50$           80.00$             480.00$           90.00$             540.00$           

56 Fleet Wetting Agent (2.5 gal) 4 EA 125.00$        500.00$           NO BID NO BID 154.17$           616.68$           100.00$           400.00$           215.00$           860.00$           

57 BioMaxx 4-0-0 Foliar (2.5 gal) 4 EA 125.00$        500.00$           NO BID NO BID 105.00$           420.00$           -$                 125.00$           500.00$           



Name of Vendor Qty UOM  Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price  Unit Price Extended Price  Unit Price Extended Price  Unit Price Extended Price

58 Potassium Plus Calcium (2.5 gal) 4 EA 135.15$        540.60$           NO BID NO BID -$                 -$                 40.00$             160.00$           

59
12-0-0 Foliar w/6%Fe, 3%Mg (2.5 

gal)
4 EA -$                 NO BID NO BID -$                 120.00$           480.00$           40.00$             160.00$           

60
6-0-0 NitratePlus w/2%Mg, 2%Fe, 

5%Mn (2.5 gal)
4 EA -$                 NO BID NO BID -$                 -$                 70.00$             280.00$           

61 Foliar Fertilizer 3-30-3 (2.5 gal) 4 EA
100.00$        400.00$           NO BID NO BID 41.13$             164.52$           -$                 50.00$             200.00$           

62
Foliar Fertilizer Max Mn 5% (2.5 

gal)
4 EA 62.50$           250.00$           NO BID NO BID 41.77$             167.08$           100.00$           400.00$           40.00$             160.00$           

63
Foliar Fertilizer Max Bio Root 

Enhancer (2.5 gal)
4 EA -$                 NO BID NO BID 111.13$           444.52$           225.00$           900.00$           65.00$             260.00$           

64
Foliar Fertilizer Max 0-0-30 (2.5 

gal)
4 EA

49.75$           199.00$           NO BID NO BID 37.72$             150.88$           155.00$           620.00$           115.00$           460.00$           

65
Foliar Fertilizer Max N30 Plus 

Umaxx (2.5 gal)
4 EA -$                 NO BID NO BID 39.14$             156.56$           -$                 60.00$             240.00$           

66 Symphony Wetting Agent (2.5 gal) 4 EA 225.00$        900.00$           NO BID NO BID 157.44$           629.76$           -$                 200.00$           800.00$           

67 Chlorothalonil 54% (2.5 gal) 4 EA
116.95$        467.80$           NO BID NO BID 80.83$             323.32$           -$                 -$                 

68 Seven 4L (2.5 gal) 2 EA
106.32$        212.64$           NO BID NO BID 94.18$             188.36$           156.00$           312.00$           101.50$           203.00$           

69 Carbaryl 43%, (2.5 gal) 2 EA 112.50$        225.00$           NO BID NO BID 94.18$             188.36$           -$                 -$                 

70 Appear Fungicide (2 gal) 2 EA 266.00$        532.00$           NO BID NO BID 266.00$           532.00$           -$                 266.00$           532.00$           

71
Monument 75WG Herbicide (0.88 

oz) 5x5 gram packets (25 grams)
100 EA

9.80$             980.00$           NO BID NO BID 9.80$               980.00$           -$                 9.80$               980.00$           

72 Azoxystrobin 50% Fungicide, lb. 8 EA
250.00$        2,000.00$       NO BID NO BID 144.32$           1,154.56$       162.50$           1,300.00$       -$                 

73
Azoxystrobin TL 8.8% minimum, 

GAL
2 EA 500.00$        1,000.00$       NO BID NO BID 636.36$           1,272.72$       567.40$           1,134.80$       -$                 

74
Lexicon Intrinsic Fungicide (21 oz 

bottle)
3 EA 483.84$        1,451.52$       NO BID NO BID 483.84$           1,451.52$       -$                 483.84$           1,451.52$        

75 Acelepryn Insecticide 0.5 gal 2 EA 977.50$        1,955.00$       NO BID NO BID 963.51$           1,927.02$       -$                 977.50$           1,955.00$        

76 Tribute Total (6 ounce bottle) 3 EA 339.07$        1,017.21$       NO BID NO BID 339.07$           1,017.21$       -$                 339.07$           1,017.21$        

77
Podium PGR (trinexapac-ethly) 

11.3%, 1 GAL
5 EA 155.43$        777.15$           NO BID NO BID 125.00$           625.00$           144.30$           721.50$           134.59$           672.95$           

78
Illoxan Herbicide, 1 GAL, NO 

AWARD
1 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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79 Primo Maxx, 1 GAL 2 EA 290.00$        580.00$           NO BID NO BID 290.00$           580.00$           -$                 290.00$           580.00$           

80 Briskway Fungicide, 1 GAL 4 EA 1,315.00$     5,260.00$       NO BID NO BID 1,315.00$       5,260.00$       -$                 1,315.00$       5,260.00$       

81
Surf King Plus Spray Adjuvant, 1 

GAL.
4 EA 30.80$           123.20$           NO BID NO BID 8.32$               33.28$             -$                 58.50$             234.00$           

82
Chemical Tank 

Cleaner/Neutralizer, 1 QT.
8 EA

17.50$           140.00$           NO BID NO BID 10.74$             85.92$             12.35$             98.80$             16.50$             132.00$           

83 Glyphosate Plus 41%, 1 GAL 4 EA 13.85$           55.40$             NO BID NO BID 11.65$             46.60$             27.63$             110.52$           35.53$             142.12$           

84 Advion Fire Ant Bait 25lb bags 45 EA 284.88$        12,819.60$     NO BID NO BID 245.00$           11,025.00$     -$                 284.90$           12,820.50$     

85 Big Foot SS quart (12/case) 10 EA
208.20$        2,082.00$       NO BID NO BID 167.04$           1,670.40$       12.68$             126.80$           258.00$           2,580.00$        

86 Surflan 2.5 gal 10 EA 115.83$        1,158.25$       NO BID NO BID 52.50$             525.00$           -$                 156.00$           1,560.00$        

87 Merit (granular for grubs) 30lb bag 185 Bags 31.50$           5,827.50$       NO BID NO BID 22.16$             4,099.60$       28.60$             5,291.00$       22.75$             4,208.75$        

88 Gallery 1 lb bottles 10 EA
125.00$        1,250.00$       NO BID NO BID 125.00$           1,250.00$       135.85$           1,358.50$       125.00$           1,250.00$        

SUBTOTAL
107,487.97$   NO BID 108,044.76$   31,551.44$     125,722.38$   

AWARD TOTALS (#1-#88) 21,067.29$     59,821.41$     18,280.21$     

ITEM DESCRIPTION Qty
Extended 

Price

 50lb Bag 
$12.00/50lb 

Bag
 50lb Bag  $    24,704.00  50lb Bag  $  50lb Bag  $    64,800.00 

 $      772.00  $        20.00 

 $  $    48,000.00  $    22,800.00  $  $    64,800.00 

 $      8.50  50lb Bag  $    12,580.00 50lb Bag  50lb Bag   $    11,100.00  50lb Bag  $  50lb Bag  $    15,540.00 

$350  $        47.50  $        10.50 

 $  340.00  $    12,580.00  $    12,950.00  $    10,656.00  $  $    15,540.00 

89.  16-3-4

 NO BID 

80 

Tons, 

annua

lly  Ton  

$800.00 

37 

Tons, 

annua

lly  Ton  

$420.00 

90.  21-0-0 - NO AWARD

$600/Ton

Ton

 Ton  

$285.12 

 Ton  

$285.00 

 Ton 

 Ton 

Unit Price      PER

 Ton 

 Ton 
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$9.00 $  $    23,912.00 $ 41,300.00

 $  360.00  $    25,200.00  $    28,700.00  $    22,610.00  $  $    41,300.00 

 $    41.00  $    20,500.00  $      8,320.00  $  $    18,250.00 

 NO BID  $  $      5,600.00  $                 -    $  $    18,250.00 

 $  $      5,600.00  $      5,140.80  $  $      7,084.00 

 NO BID  $  $  $      4,900.00  $  $      6,900.00 

NO BID

 $  $      5,900.00  $      4,900.00  $  $      6,900.00 

SUBTOTAL
70,860.00$     106,750.00$   115,130.80$   -$                 300,664.00$   

Grand Total Lines #1 - 94
178,347.97$   106,750.00$   247,087.56$   31,551.44$     426,386.38$   

TOTAL AWARD AMOUNTS:
21,067.29$     53,600.00$     -$                 129,604.21$   -$                 -$                 18,280.21$     

Discount From 

Catalog/Percentage 0% 0% 0% 0% 5%

Delivery Time/Calendar Days
2 Days 7 Days 1-4 Days  Day 1-2 Days

93.   Quick Dry

28,000 

lbs 

annual

ly

 NO BID 

70 

Tons, 

annua

lly

 50lb Bag   

$14.75 

 Ton  

$590.00 

10 

Tons, 

annua

lly

 50lb Bag  

$36.50 

 Ton  $18.25 

94.   10-24-18 Agri-Nutrients

91.    15-5-10

92.   Humic Acid

10 

Tons, 

annua

lly
 NO BID $590.00/Ton

 Ton   

$490.00 

 50lb Bag 

 Ton  Ton 

50lb Bag
 50lb Bag  

$8.54 

 50lb Bag 

 Ton 

 50lb Bag 

 50lb Bag 

 Ton 

 50lb Bag 

 Ton 

 50lb Bag 

 Ton $323.00 

 50lb Bag  

$16.64 

 Ton 0 

 50lb Bag  

$9.18 

$410.00/Ton

50lb Bag

 50lb Bag 

 Ton 

 50lb Bag 
 50lb Bag  

$12.25 

$560.00/Ton

$10.00/50lb 

Bag

50lb Bag

 50lb Bag   

$12.65 

 50lb Bag 

$17.25 

 Ton  

$690.00 



Name of Vendor Qty UOM  Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price  Unit Price Extended Price  Unit Price Extended Price  Unit Price Extended Price

1
 21-0-0 Granular, 50lb bag,  APF 

Ammonium Sulfate
1 Ton 340.00$        340.00$           NO BID NO BID 300.00$           300.00$           -$                 478.00$           478.00$           

2
 Hou-actinite Greens Grade (50 lb 

bag)
1 Ton 420.00$        420.00$           NO BID NO BID 416.00$           416.00$           -$                 540.00$           540.00$           

3
21-0-0 Sprayable 50lb bag, APF 

Ammonium Sulfate
0.50 Ton

387.60$        193.80$           NO BID NO BID 355.20$           177.60$           -$                 642.00$           321.00$           

4
13-0-45 Multi-K Sprayable, Haifa 

Multi K GG Brand, (50 lb. bag)
0.50 Ton 1,300.00$     650.00$           NO BID NO BID 1,172.80$       586.40$           -$                 -$                 

5 Andersons A-TEP (50 lb bag) 20 EA
54.00$           1,080.00$       NO BID NO BID 52.50$             1,050.00$       -$                 38.50$             770.00$           

6
Andersons 7-14-14 ContecDG 

(40lb bag)
20 EA

46.30$           926.00$           NO BID NO BID 48.50$             970.00$           -$                 55.50$             1,110.00$        

7
Andersons 12-3-12 ContecDG (40 

lb bag)
20 EA 46.40$           928.00$           NO BID NO BID 45.90$             918.00$           -$                 46.25$             925.00$           

8
Andersons Goose/Crab (28.8 lb 

bag)
20 EA 94.00$           1,880.00$       NO BID NO BID 89.77$             1,795.40$       -$                 123.95$           2,479.00$        

9
Princep (Simizine) 4L (2.5 

Gallons)
8 EA

49.07$           392.56$           NO BID NO BID 43.85$             350.80$           79.63$             637.04$           46.80$             374.40$           

10 Top Choice Fipronil (50 lb bag) 4 EA 137.50$        550.00$           NO BID NO BID 137.50$           550.00$           -$                 125.00$           500.00$           

11
Fiprnil .0143G Insecticide (30 lb 

bag)
6 EA 50.90$           305.40$           NO BID NO BID 46.69$             280.14$           50.05$             300.30$           -$                 

12
Strike 3 (3-Way) Broadleaf 

Herbicide, 2.5 Gals
8 EA

53.75$           430.00$           NO BID NO BID 66.96$             535.68$           84.50$             676.00$           58.50$             468.00$           

13 PBI Gordon Ferromec AC 30 Gal 11.00$           330.00$           NO BID NO BID 8.06$               241.80$           18.34$             550.20$           11.35$             340.50$           

14
Foliar Fertilizer 12-0-0 6%Fe, 

2:Mn, (2.5 gal)
10 EA 22.50$           225.00$           NO BID NO BID 28.51$             285.10$           107.50$           1,075.00$       40.00$             400.00$           

15 Revolution Wetting Agent (2.5 gal) 4 EA 259.38$        1,037.50$       NO BID NO BID 259.38$           1,037.52$       -$                 -$                 

BID #2018-10-4  FERTILIZER, CLAY, QUICK DRY & CHEMICALS

HARRELLSGREENSMITH'S BWI COMPANIES INC. TURF CARE OF TEXASWINFIELD



Name of Vendor Qty UOM  Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price  Unit Price Extended Price  Unit Price Extended Price  Unit Price Extended Price

16 Arena 50WDG (40 oz bottle) 1 EA 563.25$        563.25$           NO BID NO BID 563.25$           563.25$           -$                 563.25$           563.25$           

17 MSMA 6 Plus (2.5 gal) 20 EA 64.72$           1,294.40$       NO BID NO BID 66.96$             1,339.20$       105.63$           2,112.60$       74.94$             1,498.80$        

18 Iprodione Fungicide (2.5 gal) 10 EA 137.50$        1,375.00$       NO BID NO BID 102.27$           1,022.70$       143.00$           1,430.00$       107.50$           1,075.00$        

19 Prostar 70WP Fungicide, (3 lbs) 20 EA
178.62$        3,572.40$       NO BID NO BID 168.12$           3,362.40$       -$                 198.05$           3,961.00$        

20 Daconil Action Fungicide (2.5 gal) 15 EA 194.00$        2,910.00$       NO BID NO BID 194.00$           2,910.00$       -$                 194.00$           2,910.00$       

21
Daconil Weather Stik Fungicide 

(2.5 gal)
10 EA 152.50$        1,525.00$       NO BID NO BID 152.50$           1,525.00$       130.00$           1,300.00$       152.50$           1,525.00$        

22 Heritage Fungicide, 1 LB. 8 EA
317.00$        2,536.00$       NO BID NO BID 317.00$           2,536.00$       -$                 317.00$           2,536.00$        

23 Headway Fungicide, 1 GAL 4 EA 417.00$        1,668.00$       NO BID NO BID 417.00$           1,668.00$       -$                 417.00$           1,668.00$        

24 Bifenthrin Insecticide 1 GAL 8 EA 30.88$           247.04$           NO BID NO BID 30.49$             243.92$           44.20$             353.60$           38.50$             308.00$           

25
Lambda-cyhalothrin Insecticide 

9.7%, 1 QT.
8 EA

123.10$        984.80$           NO BID NO BID 131.96$           1,055.68$       62.40$             499.20$           -$                 

26 Certainty Herbicide, 1.25 ounces 12 EA
70.83$           849.90$           NO BID NO BID 76.89$             922.68$           102.70$           1,232.40$       86.65$             1,039.80$        

27 Revolver Herbicide, 1 QT. 8 EA 213.83$        1,710.64$       NO BID NO BID 216.77$           1,734.16$       -$                 259.58$           2,076.64$        

28 Celsius Herbicide (10 oz bottle) 10 EA 98.12$           981.20$           NO BID NO BID 98.12$             981.20$           -$                 98.12$             981.20$           

29 Affirm WDG Fungicide, 2.4 Lbs. 1 EA
222.96$        222.96$           NO BID NO BID 92.90$             92.90$             -$                 222.96$           222.96$           

30 Secure Fungicide, 2.5 Gallons 1 EA
1,470.00$     1,470.00$       NO BID NO BID 1,470.00$       1,470.00$       950.00$           950.00$           1,470.00$       1,470.00$        

31 26/36 Fungicide, 2.5 Gallons 10 EA 280.50$        2,805.00$       NO BID NO BID -$                 -$                 280.50$           2,805.00$        

32 Uflexx 46-0-0-Fertilizer, 50 lb bag 80 EA 22.44$           1,795.20$       NO BID NO BID 23.71$             1,896.80$       -$                 27.75$             2,220.00$        

33 Umaxx 47-0-0 Fertilizer, 50 lb bag 40 EA 28.85$           1,154.00$       NO BID NO BID 28.71$             1,148.40$       -$                 31.50$             1,260.00$        

34

28-3-10 Fertilizer with 50% 

PolySCU OR Nutrasphere 

Nitrogen, 4% Fe,  50 lb plastic bag

240 EA
15.86$           3,806.40$       NO BID NO BID 15.34$             3,681.60$       -$                 19.10$             4,584.00$        

35 BiomendDG 9-4-9, 40 lb bag 40 EA 43.50$           1,740.00$       NO BID NO BID 43.50$             1,740.00$       -$                 39.50$             1,580.00$        

36 Team 2G (40 lb bag) 20 EA 20.63$           412.60$           NO BID NO BID 18.85$             377.00$           -$                 -$                 



Name of Vendor Qty UOM  Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price  Unit Price Extended Price  Unit Price Extended Price  Unit Price Extended Price

37
Andersons 10-5-20 ContecDG 

(40lb bag)
20 EA 48.10$           962.00$           NO BID NO BID 47.60$             952.00$           -$                 52.50$             1,050.00$        

38
Andersons 18-24-5 ContecDG 

(40lb bag)
10 EA 37.20$           372.00$           NO BID NO BID -$                 -$                 -$                 

39
25-0-10 w/50%Uflex,2%Fe,2%Mg 

(50lb bag)
240 EA -$                 NO BID NO BID 13.76$             3,302.40$       -$                 19.50$             4,680.00$        

40
28-3-10 w/50%XCU, 5%Fe (50 lb 

bag)
240 EA

-$                 NO BID NO BID 15.34$             3,681.60$       -$                 19.10$             4,584.00$        

41
23-0-6 w/50% Nutrisphere-N 150 

SGN 50lb Bag
120 EA 18.67$           2,240.40$       NO BID NO BID 18.92$             2,270.40$       -$                 20.25$             2,430.00$        

42
18-0-5 w/.45% Barricade, 

30%SRN (50lb bag)
120 EA -$                 NO BID NO BID 14.50$             1,740.00$       -$                 21.95$             2,634.00$       

43
28-3-10 w/50%PolySRN, 3%Fe 

(50lb bag)
240 EA

-$                 NO BID NO BID 15.34$             3,681.60$       -$                 19.10$             4,584.00$        

44
24-2-12 w/55%SRN, 1%Fe, trace 

element pkg. (50 lb bag)
120 EA 16.00$           1,920.00$       NO BID NO BID 18.30$             2,196.00$       -$                 18.75$             2,250.00$        

45 Freehand 1.75 G (50 lb bag) 20 EA 93.50$           1,870.00$       NO BID NO BID 93.50$             1,870.00$       -$                 93.50$             1,870.00$        

46 Specticle Herbicide (1 gal) 3 EA
1,606.50$     4,819.50$       NO BID NO BID 1,606.50$       4,819.50$       -$                 1,606.50$       4,819.50$        

47 Oxadiazon Flo Herbicide (2.5 gal) 10 EA
300.00$        3,000.00$       NO BID NO BID 123.42$           1,234.20$       386.75$           3,867.50$       412.50$           4,125.00$        

48 Prodiamine 65 WDG Herbicide (lb) 100 EA 9.88$             988.00$           NO BID NO BID 8.89$               889.00$           13.00$             1,300.00$       48.95$             4,895.00$        

49 Subdue Maxx (1 gal) 2 EA 520.00$        1,040.00$       NO BID NO BID 520.00$           1,040.00$       436.84$           873.68$           520.00$           1,040.00$       

50 Velista Fungicide (22 oz bottle) 8 EA
204.60$        1,636.80$       NO BID NO BID 204.60$           1,636.80$       -$                 204.60$           1,636.80$        

51
Foliar Fertilizer 18-3-6 w/50%SRN 

(2.5 Gal)
4 EA

40.00$           160.00$           NO BID NO BID 40.43$             161.72$           -$                 55.00$             220.00$           

52
Fore80 Rainshield WSP (48 lb 

case)
2 EA 420.00$        840.00$           NO BID NO BID 377.84$           755.68$           -$                 452.24$           904.48$           

53
Calcium 8.25% Soil Remediation 

(2.5gal)
6 EA 85.73$           514.35$           NO BID NO BID 47.04$             282.24$           110.00$           660.00$           40.00$             240.00$           

54 Salt RX Soil Remediation (2.5 gal) 6 EA -$                 NO BID NO BID 93.32$             559.92$           -$                 95.00$             570.00$           

55
EArthMax Soil Remediation (2.5 

gal)
6 EA 101.50$        609.00$           NO BID NO BID 36.75$             220.50$           80.00$             480.00$           90.00$             540.00$           

56 Fleet Wetting Agent (2.5 gal) 4 EA 125.00$        500.00$           NO BID NO BID 154.17$           616.68$           100.00$           400.00$           215.00$           860.00$           

57 BioMaxx 4-0-0 Foliar (2.5 gal) 4 EA 125.00$        500.00$           NO BID NO BID 105.00$           420.00$           -$                 125.00$           500.00$           



Name of Vendor Qty UOM  Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price  Unit Price Extended Price  Unit Price Extended Price  Unit Price Extended Price

58 Potassium Plus Calcium (2.5 gal) 4 EA 135.15$        540.60$           NO BID NO BID -$                 -$                 40.00$             160.00$           

59
12-0-0 Foliar w/6%Fe, 3%Mg (2.5 

gal)
4 EA -$                 NO BID NO BID -$                 120.00$           480.00$           40.00$             160.00$           

60
6-0-0 NitratePlus w/2%Mg, 2%Fe, 

5%Mn (2.5 gal)
4 EA -$                 NO BID NO BID -$                 -$                 70.00$             280.00$           

61 Foliar Fertilizer 3-30-3 (2.5 gal) 4 EA
100.00$        400.00$           NO BID NO BID 41.13$             164.52$           -$                 50.00$             200.00$           

62
Foliar Fertilizer Max Mn 5% (2.5 

gal)
4 EA 62.50$           250.00$           NO BID NO BID 41.77$             167.08$           100.00$           400.00$           40.00$             160.00$           

63
Foliar Fertilizer Max Bio Root 

Enhancer (2.5 gal)
4 EA -$                 NO BID NO BID 111.13$           444.52$           225.00$           900.00$           65.00$             260.00$           

64
Foliar Fertilizer Max 0-0-30 (2.5 

gal)
4 EA

49.75$           199.00$           NO BID NO BID 37.72$             150.88$           155.00$           620.00$           115.00$           460.00$           

65
Foliar Fertilizer Max N30 Plus 

Umaxx (2.5 gal)
4 EA -$                 NO BID NO BID 39.14$             156.56$           -$                 60.00$             240.00$           

66 Symphony Wetting Agent (2.5 gal) 4 EA 225.00$        900.00$           NO BID NO BID 157.44$           629.76$           -$                 200.00$           800.00$           

67 Chlorothalonil 54% (2.5 gal) 4 EA
116.95$        467.80$           NO BID NO BID 80.83$             323.32$           -$                 -$                 

68 Seven 4L (2.5 gal) 2 EA
106.32$        212.64$           NO BID NO BID 94.18$             188.36$           156.00$           312.00$           101.50$           203.00$           

69 Carbaryl 43%, (2.5 gal) 2 EA 112.50$        225.00$           NO BID NO BID 94.18$             188.36$           -$                 -$                 

70 Appear Fungicide (2 gal) 2 EA 266.00$        532.00$           NO BID NO BID 266.00$           532.00$           -$                 266.00$           532.00$           

71
Monument 75WG Herbicide (0.88 

oz) 5x5 gram packets (25 grams)
100 EA

9.80$             980.00$           NO BID NO BID 9.80$               980.00$           -$                 9.80$               980.00$           

72 Azoxystrobin 50% Fungicide, lb. 8 EA
250.00$        2,000.00$       NO BID NO BID 144.32$           1,154.56$       162.50$           1,300.00$       -$                 

73
Azoxystrobin TL 8.8% minimum, 

GAL
2 EA 500.00$        1,000.00$       NO BID NO BID 636.36$           1,272.72$       567.40$           1,134.80$       -$                 

74
Lexicon Intrinsic Fungicide (21 oz 

bottle)
3 EA 483.84$        1,451.52$       NO BID NO BID 483.84$           1,451.52$       -$                 483.84$           1,451.52$        

75 Acelepryn Insecticide 0.5 gal 2 EA 977.50$        1,955.00$       NO BID NO BID 963.51$           1,927.02$       -$                 977.50$           1,955.00$        

76 Tribute Total (6 ounce bottle) 3 EA 339.07$        1,017.21$       NO BID NO BID 339.07$           1,017.21$       -$                 339.07$           1,017.21$        

77
Podium PGR (trinexapac-ethly) 

11.3%, 1 GAL
5 EA 155.43$        777.15$           NO BID NO BID 125.00$           625.00$           144.30$           721.50$           134.59$           672.95$           

78
Illoxan Herbicide, 1 GAL, NO 

AWARD
1 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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79 Primo Maxx, 1 GAL 2 EA 290.00$        580.00$           NO BID NO BID 290.00$           580.00$           -$                 290.00$           580.00$           

80 Briskway Fungicide, 1 GAL 4 EA 1,315.00$     5,260.00$       NO BID NO BID 1,315.00$       5,260.00$       -$                 1,315.00$       5,260.00$       

81
Surf King Plus Spray Adjuvant, 1 

GAL.
4 EA 30.80$           123.20$           NO BID NO BID 8.32$               33.28$             -$                 58.50$             234.00$           

82
Chemical Tank 

Cleaner/Neutralizer, 1 QT.
8 EA

17.50$           140.00$           NO BID NO BID 10.74$             85.92$             12.35$             98.80$             16.50$             132.00$           

83 Glyphosate Plus 41%, 1 GAL 4 EA 13.85$           55.40$             NO BID NO BID 11.65$             46.60$             27.63$             110.52$           35.53$             142.12$           

84 Advion Fire Ant Bait 25lb bags 45 EA 284.88$        12,819.60$     NO BID NO BID 245.00$           11,025.00$     -$                 284.90$           12,820.50$     

85 Big Foot SS quart (12/case) 10 EA
208.20$        2,082.00$       NO BID NO BID 167.04$           1,670.40$       12.68$             126.80$           258.00$           2,580.00$        

86 Surflan 2.5 gal 10 EA 115.83$        1,158.25$       NO BID NO BID 52.50$             525.00$           -$                 156.00$           1,560.00$        

87 Merit (granular for grubs) 30lb bag 185 Bags 31.50$           5,827.50$       NO BID NO BID 22.16$             4,099.60$       28.60$             5,291.00$       22.75$             4,208.75$        

88 Gallery 1 lb bottles 10 EA
125.00$        1,250.00$       NO BID NO BID 125.00$           1,250.00$       135.85$           1,358.50$       125.00$           1,250.00$        

SUBTOTAL
107,487.97$   NO BID 108,044.76$   31,551.44$     125,722.38$   

AWARD TOTALS (#1-#88) 21,067.29$     59,821.41$     18,280.21$     

ITEM DESCRIPTION Qty
Extended 

Price

 50lb Bag 
$12.00/50lb 

Bag
 50lb Bag  $    24,704.00  50lb Bag  $  50lb Bag  $    64,800.00 

 $      772.00  $        20.00 

 $  $    48,000.00  $    22,800.00  $  $    64,800.00 

 $      8.50  50lb Bag  $    12,580.00 50lb Bag  50lb Bag   $    11,100.00  50lb Bag  $  50lb Bag  $    15,540.00 

$350  $        47.50  $        10.50 

 $  340.00  $    12,580.00  $    12,950.00  $    10,656.00  $  $    15,540.00 

89.  16-3-4

 NO BID 

80 

Tons, 

annua

lly  Ton  

$800.00 

37 

Tons, 

annua

lly  Ton  

$420.00 

90.  21-0-0 - NO AWARD

$600/Ton

Ton

 Ton  

$285.12 

 Ton  

$285.00 

 Ton 

 Ton 

Unit Price      PER

 Ton 

 Ton 



Name of Vendor Qty UOM  Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price  Unit Price Extended Price  Unit Price Extended Price  Unit Price Extended Price

$9.00 $  $    23,912.00 $ 41,300.00

 $  360.00  $    25,200.00  $    28,700.00  $    22,610.00  $  $    41,300.00 

 $    41.00  $    20,500.00  $      8,320.00  $  $    18,250.00 

 NO BID  $  $      5,600.00  $                 -    $  $    18,250.00 

 $  $      5,600.00  $      5,140.80  $  $      7,084.00 

 NO BID  $  $  $      4,900.00  $  $      6,900.00 

NO BID

 $  $      5,900.00  $      4,900.00  $  $      6,900.00 

SUBTOTAL
70,860.00$     106,750.00$   115,130.80$   -$                 300,664.00$   

Grand Total Lines #1 - 94
178,347.97$   106,750.00$   247,087.56$   31,551.44$     426,386.38$   

TOTAL AWARD AMOUNTS:
21,067.29$     53,600.00$     -$                 129,604.21$   -$                 -$                 18,280.21$     

Discount From 

Catalog/Percentage 0% 0% 0% 0% 5%

Delivery Time/Calendar Days
2 Days 7 Days 1-4 Days  Day 1-2 Days

93.   Quick Dry

28,000 

lbs 

annual

ly

 NO BID 

70 

Tons, 

annua

lly

 50lb Bag   

$14.75 

 Ton  

$590.00 

10 

Tons, 

annua

lly

 50lb Bag  

$36.50 

 Ton  $18.25 

94.   10-24-18 Agri-Nutrients

91.    15-5-10

92.   Humic Acid

10 

Tons, 

annua

lly
 NO BID $590.00/Ton

 Ton   

$490.00 

 50lb Bag 

 Ton  Ton 

50lb Bag
 50lb Bag  

$8.54 

 50lb Bag 

 Ton 

 50lb Bag 

 50lb Bag 

 Ton 

 50lb Bag 

 Ton 

 50lb Bag 

 Ton $323.00 

 50lb Bag  

$16.64 

 Ton 0 

 50lb Bag  

$9.18 

$410.00/Ton

50lb Bag

 50lb Bag 

 Ton 

 50lb Bag 
 50lb Bag  

$12.25 

$560.00/Ton

$10.00/50lb 

Bag

50lb Bag

 50lb Bag   

$12.65 

 50lb Bag 

$17.25 

 Ton  

$690.00 




