
Event Number 2020-6-101 Organization City of Allen Purchasing

Event Title PURCHASE AND INSTALLATION OF VEHICLE SAFETY EQUIPMENT & ACCESSORIESWorkgroup Purchasing

Event Description GENERAL INFORMATION         CITY OF ALLEN, TEXAS   PROPOSALS WILL BE ACCEPTED IN THE OFFICE OF THE PURCHASING MANAGER         REQUEST FOR PROPOSAL   2020-6-101   PURCHASE AND INSTALLATION OF VEHICLE SAFETY EQUIPMENT  ACCESSORIES      PROPOSALS ARE DUE TO THE   PURCHASING DIVISION PRIOR TO:      AUGUST 28, 2020 @ 2:00 P.M.      ELECTRONIC RESPONSES SUBMITTED THROUGH   IONWAVE E-BID SYSTEM ARE RECOMMENDED   http://allentx.ionwave.net      NO LATE PROPOSALS WILL BE ACCEPTED   FACSIMILE OR E-MAILED PROPOSALS WILL NOT BE ACCEPTED         PROPOSAL PACKAGES   MAY BE DELIVERED OR MAILED TO:                	             FOR ADDITIONAL INFORMATION CONCERNING THIS PROPOSAL PLEASE CONTACT:      Casey Bennett, Purchasing Analyst, 214-509-4643, cbennett@cityofallen.orgEvent Owner Casey Bennett

Event Type RFP Email cbennett@cityofallen.org

Issue Date 8/6/2020 08:00:01 AM (CT) Phone

Close Date 8/28/2020 02:00:00 PM (CT) Fax

Responding Supplier City State Response Submitted Lines Responded Response Total

Pursuit Safety, Inc. Royse City TX 8/28/2020 11:33:04 AM (CT) 0 $0.00

Priority Public Safety LLC. Van Alstyne TX 8/27/2020 01:41:55 PM (CT) 0 $0.00

Dana Safety Supply North Carolina NC 8/20/2020 11:22:43 AM (CT) 0 $0.00

Please note: Lines Responded and Response Total only includes responses to specification.  No alternate response data is included.
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Total Price $22,373.91 Total Price $15,963.40 Total Price $39,181.90

Line #Description Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended

1 Basic Patrol Package 1,000.00$     1,000.00$          787.50$         787.50$             1,450.00$       1,450.00$          

2 Basic CID/Admin Package 850.00$         850.00$             472.50$         472.50$             1,250.00$       1,250.00$          

3 Upcharge for Non-Certified Police Package Vehicles -$               -$                    50.00$           50.00$               200.00$          200.00$             

4 Motorcycle (Police Package Only) 540.00$         540.00$             630.00$         630.00$             2,400.00$       2,400.00$          

5 Non-Police Package Motorcycles 540.00$         540.00$             52.50$           52.50$               YES YES

6 M/C Radio 135.00$         135.00$             157.50$         157.50$             350.00$          350.00$             

7 M/C Setcom 135.00$         135.00$             157.50$         157.50$             300.00$          300.00$             

8 M/C Camera System 202.50$         202.50$             210.00$         210.00$             475.00$          475.00$             

9 M/C Radar 135.00$         135.00$             157.50$         157.50$             375.00$          375.00$             

10 12 Volt Receptacles 3 Outlet (each) 67.50$           67.50$               12.50$           12.50$               25.00$            25.00$               

11 Antenna - Cell Phone - On Glass Mount 67.50$           67.50$               32.50$           32.50$               65.00$            65.00$               

12 Antenna - Data Modem - NMO Mount 101.25$         101.25$             27.50$           27.50$               45.00$            45.00$               

13 Antenna - GPS - NMO Mount 101.25$         101.25$             27.50$           27.50$               45.00$            45.00$               

14 Antenna - Multi Use - NMO Mount 101.25$         101.25$             27.50$           27.50$               200.00$          200.00$             

15 Antenna - Radio - NMO Mount 101.25$         101.25$             27.50$           27.50$               45.00$            45.00$               

16 Arrow Board Rack 101.25$         101.25$             105.00$         105.00$             170.00$          170.00$             

17 Arrow Stick - Mount & Wire  101.25$         101.25$             78.75$           78.75$               200.00$          200.00$             

18 Camera - Coban Edge System (standard triggers included) 270.00$         270.00$             157.50$         157.50$             450.00$          450.00$             

19

Camera - Coban M7 - Camera/Computer System (standard 

triggers included) 270.00$         270.00$             157.50$         157.50$             700.00$          700.00$             

20 Camera - Back Up 135.00$         135.00$             157.50$         157.50$             275.00$          275.00$             

21 Camera - Digital Ally (standard triggers included) 270.00$         270.00$             157.50$         157.50$             375.00$          375.00$             

22 Camera - Mobile Vision (standard triggers included) 270.00$         270.00$             157.50$         157.50$             375.00$          375.00$             

23 Camera - Panasonic (standard triggers included) 337.50$         337.50$             157.50$         157.50$             375.00$          375.00$             

24 Camera - WatchGuard (standard triggers included) 270.00$         270.00$             157.50$         157.50$             375.00$          375.00$             

25 Camera - Thermal 270.00$         270.00$             157.50$         157.50$             300.00$          300.00$             

26 Camera - VHS (standard triggers included) 270.00$         270.00$             157.50$         157.50$             375.00$          375.00$             

27 Camera - Add Exterior Camera to System 67.50$           67.50$               52.50$           52.50$               150.00$          150.00$             

28 Camera - Additional Trigger 67.50$           67.50$               26.25$           26.25$               85.00$            85.00$               

29 Computer and MDC - Multi Piece Remote Mount 101.25$         101.25$             157.50$         157.50$             375.00$          375.00$             

30 Computer and MDC - Laptop 101.25$         101.25$             105.00$         105.00$             250.00$          250.00$             

31 Computer - External Modem (Rocket, Sierra Wireless, etc.) 101.25$         101.25$             105.00$         105.00$             250.00$          250.00$             

32 Console - Heavy Duty - Mount Only  135.00$         135.00$             52.50$           52.50$               85.00$            85.00$               

Pursuit Safety, Inc.Priority Public Safety LLC.Dana Safety Supply

INSTALLATION SERVICES
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33 Door - Panels (Slicks) 33.75$           33.75$               52.50$           52.50$               130.00$          130.00$             

34 Door - Window Guards 33.75$           33.75$               52.50$           52.50$               85.00$            85.00$               

35 Extendo Bed 337.50$         337.50$             242.50$         242.50$             450.00$          450.00$             

36 Flasher - Head Light - Mount and Wire 67.50$           67.50$               65.00$           65.00$               125.00$          125.00$             

37 Flashlight Charger (each) 33.75$           33.75$               25.00$           25.00$               85.00$            85.00$               

38 Gas Reader 135.00$         135.00$             78.75$           78.75$               85.00$            85.00$               

39 GPS - AVL System 135.00$         135.00$             52.50$           52.50$               170.00$          170.00$             

40 GPS - Dash Mounted - Portable (Garmin etc…) 67.50$           67.50$               52.50$           52.50$               85.00$            85.00$               

41

GRAPHICS - Provide materials, lay-out, print, cut and install 

"Police" graphics on sides of marked vehicles - CITY OF 

ALLEN ONLY - ALL OTHERS WILL BE QUOTED BASED ON 

DESIGN 725.00$         725.00$             650.00$         650.00$             700.00$          700.00$             

42

GRAPHICS Removal of graphics from old vehicles - CITY OF 

ALLEN ONLY - ALL OTHERS WILL BE QUOTED BASED ON 

DESIGN 250.00$         250.00$             No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

43 Gun Rack - Single or Dual 67.50$           67.50$               52.50$           52.50$               100.00$          100.00$             

44 Gun Rack - Rear Mounted 67.50$           67.50$               52.50$           52.50$               200.00$          200.00$             

45 Heavy Duty Equipment Console - Mount 135.00$         135.00$             52.50$           52.50$               85.00$            85.00$               

46 Inverter - Up to 500 Watt 135.00$         135.00$             105.00$         105.00$             150.00$          150.00$             

47 K-9 Cage Only 270.00$         270.00$             157.50$         157.50$             400.00$          400.00$             

48 K-9 Hot Dog & Bail Out System - Only (See ### for details) 270.00$         270.00$             315.00$         315.00$             500.00$          500.00$             

49 K-9 Hot Dog Fan 67.50$           67.50$               52.50$           52.50$               100.00$          100.00$             

50 K-9 Hot Dog System (See ### For details) 202.50$         202.50$             210.00$         210.00$             450.00$          450.00$             

51 Light Bar - Mount and Wire 135.00$         135.00$             105.00$         105.00$             200.00$          200.00$             

52 Labor Rate for Non Contract Services 67.50$           67.50$               52.50$           52.50$               85.00$            85.00$               

53 Lighting Control Box - Mount and Wire 202.50$         202.50$             157.50$         157.50$             175.00$          175.00$             

54 Lighting Control Box - Switch (each) 45.00$           45.00$               25.00$           25.00$               85.00$            85.00$               

55 LPR - 1 Head 202.50$         202.50$             157.50$         157.50$             550.00$          550.00$             

56 LPR - 2 Head 270.00$         270.00$             210.00$         210.00$             675.00$          675.00$             

57 LPR - 3 Head 337.50$         337.50$             262.50$         262.50$             800.00$          800.00$             

58 Mileage Fee 0.58$             0.58$                  0.65$             0.65$                  0.95$               0.95$                  

59 Standard Trip Fee 0.58$             0.58$                  50.00$           50.00$               425.00$          425.00$             

60 Opticom 67.50$           67.50$               78.75$           78.75$               200.00$          200.00$             

61 Printer - Large Full Size 67.50$           67.50$               105.00$         105.00$             350.00$          350.00$             

62 Printer - Small Tickets 67.50$           67.50$               52.50$           52.50$               170.00$          170.00$             

63 Prisoner Barrier - Front or Rear 135.00$         135.00$             78.75$           78.75$               200.00$          200.00$             

64 Prisoner Seat 135.00$         135.00$             52.50$           52.50$               170.00$          170.00$             

65 Prisoner Transport System (PROCELL) 270.00$         270.00$             315.00$         315.00$             700.00$          700.00$             
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66 Prisoner Transport with K-9 Kennel (1 system) 270.00$         270.00$             420.00$         420.00$             700.00$          700.00$             

67 Pushbumper 135.00$         135.00$             78.75$           78.75$               425.00$          425.00$             

68 Radar 135.00$         135.00$             105.00$         105.00$             250.00$          250.00$             

69 Radio 1 Piece (2 way, scanner, CB, etc.) 135.00$         135.00$             105.00$         105.00$             100.00$          100.00$             

70 Radio 2 Piece 135.00$         135.00$             131.25$         131.25$             250.00$          250.00$             

71 Radio - External Speaker 135.00$         135.00$             25.00$           25.00$               85.00$            85.00$               

72 Radio - Vehicle Charger 67.50$           67.50$               25.00$           25.00$               85.00$            85.00$               

73 Scale Rack 67.50$           67.50$               175.00$         175.00$             250.00$          250.00$             

74 Shop Fee - Consumables 250.00$         250.00$             50.00$           50.00$               100.00$          100.00$             

75 Siren Amplifier - 1 Piece 135.00$         135.00$             105.00$         105.00$             170.00$          170.00$             

76 Siren Amplifier - 2 Piece (Remote Mount) 270.00$         270.00$             105.00$         105.00$             250.00$          250.00$             

77 Siren Speaker 1 Mount and Wire 67.50$           67.50$               52.50$           52.50$               125.00$          125.00$             

78 Siren Speaker 2 Mount and Wire 75.50$           75.50$               52.50$           52.50$               200.00$          200.00$             

79 Storage Vault - Standard Size 135.00$         135.00$             78.75$           78.75$               200.00$          200.00$             

80 Storage Vault - Large Size 155.00$         155.00$             105.00$         105.00$             200.00$          200.00$             

81 Trunk Tray 175.00$         175.00$             52.50$           52.50$               200.00$          200.00$             

82 Fire Ext, Stop Sticks 33.75$           33.75$               25.00$           25.00$               85.00$            85.00$               

83

Warning Lts - INSTALL CONCEALED PARKING LAMP LED 

INSERTS INTO DOUBLE CASED HEADLIGHT OR TAILLIGHT 

ASSEMBLIES (THIS REQUIRES THAT THE OUTER PLASTIC OF 

THE LIGHT ASSY. BE CUT OUT WITH A HOT KNIFE TO GAIN 

ACCESS TO THE AREA FOR THE LED TO BE INSTALLED, 

AFTER MOUNTING THE LED, THE PLASTIC THAT WAS CUT 

OUT TO GAIN ACCESS HAS TO BE PUT BACK IN PLACE AND 

RESEALED. IF REASEALING IS NOT DONE IT WILL ALLOW 

THE HEADLIGHT ASSEMBLY TO FOG OVER WITH MOISTURE. 

(not recommended for strobe application) 67.50$           67.50$               78.75$           78.75$               200.00$          200.00$             

84 Warning Lts - Concealed Grill - Mount and Wire 135.00$         135.00$             78.75$           78.75$               200.00$          200.00$             

85 Warning Lts - Front Mounted- Mount and Wire 135.00$         135.00$             78.75$           78.75$               200.00$          200.00$             

86 Warning Lts - Rear Mounted - Mount and Wire 135.00$         135.00$             78.75$           78.75$               250.00$          250.00$             

87 Warning Lts - Rear Deck Mounted Lights - Mount and Wire 135.00$         135.00$             78.75$           78.75$               250.00$          250.00$             

88 Warning Lts - Windshield or Dash Mounted - 1 Piece 135.00$         135.00$             78.75$           78.75$               200.00$          200.00$             

89 Wrecked and non rolling - Drag unit into/out of shop -$               -$                    50.00$           50.00$               170.00$          170.00$             

90 Basic Patrol Package 350.00$         350.00$             262.50$         262.50$             950.00$          950.00$             

91 Basic CID/Admin Package 250.00$         250.00$             157.50$         157.50$             500.00$          500.00$             

REMOVAL SERVICES
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92 Upcharge for Non-Certified Police Package Vehicles -$               -$                    No Bid No Bid 125.00$          125.00$             

93 Motorcycle (Police Package Only) 245.00$         245.00$             160.00$         160.00$             1,000.00$       1,000.00$          

94 Non-Police Package Motorcycles 245.00$         245.00$             52.50$           52.50$               YES YES

95 M/C Radio 67.50$           67.50$               78.75$           78.75$               200.00$          200.00$             

96 M/C Setcom 67.50$           67.50$               78.75$           78.75$               200.00$          200.00$             

97 M/C Camera System 101.25$         101.25$             105.00$         105.00$             225.00$          225.00$             

98 M/C Radar 67.50$           67.50$               78.75$           78.75$               225.00$          225.00$             

99 12 Volt Receptacles 3 Outlet (each) 35.00$           35.00$               10.00$           10.00$               10.00$            10.00$               

100 Antenna - Cell Phone - On Glass Mount 35.00$           35.00$               15.00$           15.00$               25.00$            25.00$               

101 Antenna - Data Modem - NMO Mount 67.50$           67.50$               15.00$           15.00$               25.00$            25.00$               

102 Antenna - GPS - NMO Mount 67.50$           67.50$               15.00$           15.00$               25.00$            25.00$               

103 Antenna - Multi Use - NMO Mount 67.50$           67.50$               15.00$           15.00$               85.00$            85.00$               

104 Antenna - Radio - NMO Mount 67.50$           67.50$               15.00$           15.00$               25.00$            25.00$               

105 Arrow Board Rack 67.50$           67.50$               55.00$           55.00$               85.00$            85.00$               

106 Arrow Stick - Mount & Wire  67.50$           67.50$               40.00$           40.00$               85.00$            85.00$               

107 Camera - Coban Edge System (standard triggers included) 135.00$         135.00$             78.75$           78.75$               200.00$          200.00$             

108

Camera - Coban M7 - Camera/Computer System (standard 

triggers included) 135.00$         135.00$             78.75$           78.75$               275.00$          275.00$             

109 Camera - Back Up 67.50$           67.50$               78.75$           78.75$               170.00$          170.00$             

110 Camera - Digital Ally (standard triggers included) 135.00$         135.00$             78.75$           78.75$               200.00$          200.00$             

111 Camera - Mobile Vision (standard triggers included) 135.00$         135.00$             78.75$           78.75$               200.00$          200.00$             

112 Camera - Panasonic (standard triggers included) 168.75$         168.75$             78.75$           78.75$               200.00$          200.00$             

113 Camera - WatchGuard (standard triggers included) 135.00$         135.00$             78.75$           78.75$               200.00$          200.00$             

114 Camera - Thermal 135.00$         135.00$             78.75$           78.75$               150.00$          150.00$             

115 Camera - VHS (standard triggers included) 135.00$         135.00$             78.75$           78.75$               200.00$          200.00$             

116 Camera - Add Exterior Camera to System 67.50$           67.50$               25.00$           25.00$               85.00$            85.00$               

117 Camera - Additional Trigger -$               -$                    15.00$           15.00$               85.00$            85.00$               

118 Computer and MDC - Multi Piece Remote Mount 67.50$           67.50$               78.75$           78.75$               225.00$          225.00$             

119 Computer and MDC - Laptop 67.50$           67.50$               52.50$           52.50$               150.00$          150.00$             

120 Computer - External Modem (Rocket, Sierra Wireless, etc.) 67.50$           67.50$               52.50$           52.50$               100.00$          100.00$             
121 Console - Heavy Duty - Mount Only  67.50$           67.50$               25.00$           25.00$               45.00$            45.00$               

122 Door - Panels (Slicks) 17.00$           17.00$               25.00$           25.00$               45.00$            45.00$               

123 Door - Window Guards 17.00$           17.00$               25.00$           25.00$               45.00$            45.00$               

124 Extendo Bed 202.50$         202.50$             136.50$         136.50$             250.00$          250.00$             

125 Flasher - Head Light - Mount and Wire 33.75$           33.75$               26.50$           26.50$               85.00$            85.00$               

126 Flashlight Charger (each) 17.00$           17.00$               15.00$           15.00$               15.00$            15.00$               

127 Gas Reader 67.50$           67.50$               40.00$           40.00$               45.00$            45.00$               
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128 GPS - AVL System 67.50$           67.50$               26.50$           26.50$               85.00$            85.00$               

129 GPS - Dash Mounted - Portable (Garmin etc…) 33.75$           33.75$               26.50$           26.50$               35.00$            35.00$               

130

GRAPHICS - Provide materials, lay-out, print, cut and install 

"Police" graphics on sides of marked vehicles - CITY OF 

ALLEN ONLY - ALL OTHERS WILL BE QUOTED BASED ON 

DESIGN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

131

GRAPHICS Removal of graphics from old vehicles - CITY OF 

ALLEN ONLY - ALL OTHERS WILL BE QUOTED BASED ON 

DESIGN No Bid No Bid 225.00$         225.00$             250.00$          250.00$             

132 Gun Rack - Single or Dual 33.75$           33.75$               26.50$           26.50$               45.00$            45.00$               

133 Gun Rack - Rear Mounted 33.75$           33.75$               26.50$           26.50$               45.00$            45.00$               

134 Heavy Duty Equipment Console - Mount 67.50$           67.50$               26.50$           26.50$               45.00$            45.00$               

135 Inverter - Up to 500 Watt 67.50$           67.50$               40.00$           40.00$               45.00$            45.00$               

136 K-9 Cage Only 135.00$         135.00$             78.75$           78.75$               170.00$          170.00$             

137 K-9 Hot Dog & Bail Out System - Only (See ### for details) 135.00$         135.00$             130.00$         130.00$             250.00$          250.00$             

138 K-9 Hot Dog Fan 33.75$           33.75$               26.50$           26.50$               45.00$            45.00$               

139 K-9 Hot Dog System (See ### For details) 101.25$         101.25$             80.00$           80.00$               175.00$          175.00$             

140 Light Bar - Mount and Wire 67.50$           67.50$               52.50$           52.50$               85.00$            85.00$               

141 Labor Rate for Non Contract Services -$               -$                    26.50$           26.50$               85.00$            85.00$               

142 Lighting Control Box - Mount and Wire 101.25$         101.25$             40.00$           40.00$               45.00$            45.00$               

143 Lighting Control Box - Switch (each) 22.50$           22.50$               15.00$           15.00$               25.00$            25.00$               

144 LPR - 1 Head 101.25$         101.25$             60.00$           60.00$               250.00$          250.00$             

145 LPR - 2 Head 135.00$         135.00$             105.00$         105.00$             335.00$          335.00$             

146 LPR - 3 Head 168.75$         168.75$             136.50$         136.50$             420.00$          420.00$             

147 Mileage Fee -$               -$                    N/A N/A 0.95$               0.95$                  

148 Standard Trip Fee -$               -$                    N/A N/A No Bid No Bid

149 Opticom 33.75$           33.75$               40.00$           40.00$               85.00$            85.00$               

150 Printer - Large Full Size 33.75$           33.75$               52.50$           52.50$               170.00$          170.00$             

151 Printer - Small Tickets 33.75$           33.75$               26.50$           26.50$               85.00$            85.00$               

152 Prisoner Barrier - Front or Rear 67.50$           67.50$               35.00$           35.00$               130.00$          130.00$             

153 Prisoner Seat 67.50$           67.50$               26.50$           26.50$               120.00$          120.00$             

154 Prisoner Transport System (PROCELL) 135.00$         135.00$             115.00$         115.00$             380.00$          380.00$             

155 Prisoner Transport with K-9 Kennel (1 system) 135.00$         135.00$             210.00$         210.00$             380.00$          380.00$             

156 Pushbumper 67.50$           67.50$               40.00$           40.00$               425.00$          425.00$             

157 Radar 67.50$           67.50$               35.00$           35.00$               150.00$          150.00$             

158 Radio 1 Piece (2 way, scanner, CB, etc.) 67.50$           67.50$               35.00$           35.00$               45.00$            45.00$               

159 Radio 2 Piece 67.50$           67.50$               50.00$           50.00$               170.00$          170.00$             
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160 Radio - External Speaker 67.50$           67.50$               10.00$           10.00$               25.00$            25.00$               

161 Radio - Vehicle Charger 33.75$           33.75$               10.00$           10.00$               25.00$            25.00$               

162 Scale Rack 33.75$           33.75$               78.75$           78.75$               125.00$          125.00$             

163 Shop Fee - Consumables -$               -$                    N/A N/A No Bid No Bid

164 Siren Amplifier - 1 Piece 67.50$           67.50$               40.00$           40.00$               85.00$            85.00$               

165 Siren Amplifier - 2 Piece (Remote Mount) 135.00$         135.00$             52.50$           52.50$               125.00$          125.00$             

166 Siren Speaker 1 Mount and Wire 33.75$           33.75$               26.50$           26.50$               85.00$            85.00$               

167 Siren Speaker 2 Mount and Wire 33.75$           33.75$               26.50$           26.50$               105.00$          105.00$             

168 Storage Vault - Standard Size 75.00$           75.00$               26.50$           26.50$               100.00$          100.00$             

169 Storage Vault - Large Size 100.00$         100.00$             52.50$           52.50$               100.00$          100.00$             

170 Trunk Tray 125.00$         125.00$             26.50$           26.50$               85.00$            85.00$               

171 Fire Ext, Stop Sticks 33.75$           33.75$               15.00$           15.00$               85.00$            85.00$               

172

Warning Lts - INSTALL CONCEALED PARKING LAMP LED 

INSERTS INTO DOUBLE CASED HEADLIGHT OR TAILLIGHT 

ASSEMBLIES (THIS REQUIRES THAT THE OUTER PLASTIC OF 

THE LIGHT ASSY. BE CUT OUT WITH A HOT KNIFE TO GAIN 

ACCESS TO THE AREA FOR THE LED TO BE INSTALLED, 

AFTER MOUNTING THE LED, THE PLASTIC THAT WAS CUT 

OUT TO GAIN ACCESS HAS TO BE PUT BACK IN PLACE AND 

RESEALED. IF REASEALING IS NOT DONE IT WILL ALLOW 

THE HEADLIGHT ASSEMBLY TO FOG OVER WITH MOISTURE. 

(not recommended for strobe application) 33.75$           33.75$               40.00$           40.00$               85.00$            85.00$               

173 Warning Lts - Concealed Grill - Mount and Wire 67.50$           67.50$               40.00$           40.00$               85.00$            85.00$               

174 Warning Lts - Front Mounted- Mount and Wire 67.50$           67.50$               40.00$           40.00$               85.00$            85.00$               

175 Warning Lts - Rear Mounted - Mount and Wire 67.50$           67.50$               40.00$           40.00$               85.00$            85.00$               

176 Warning Lts - Rear Deck Mounted Lights - Mount and Wire 67.50$           67.50$               40.00$           40.00$               85.00$            85.00$               

177 Warning Lts - Windshield or Dash Mounted - 1 Piece 67.50$           67.50$               40.00$           40.00$               85.00$            85.00$               

178 Wrecked and non rolling - Drag unit into/out of shop 67.50$           67.50$               50.00$           50.00$               170.00$          170.00$             

179

Shipping for non truck freight items and LTL truck frieght 

will have charges applied. -$               -$                    -$               -$                    YES YES

180 Discount off of manufacturers price sheet

181 Parts and Labor Warranty

182 Please indicate any additional discounts allowed to the City

OTHER CHARGES, DISCOUNTS AND WARRANTIES

Lifetime Labor; Parts Manufacture Warranty

1.5% of list for 25 units or more

2-53% based on manufacturer 5% Minimum

1 year

Ad hoc
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Line Responding Supplier Supplier Notes
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Line # Att # Attribute Name Attribute Note Pursuit Safety, Inc. Priority Public Safety LLC. Dana Safety Supply
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Responding Supplier Signature Full Name Signature Email Supplier Notes

Pursuit Safety, Inc. Tony Edgemon tony@pursuitsafety.com

PLEASE FIND SUBMITTED BID ATTACHED

RFP Document (2020-6-101) FILLED OUT-SIGNED-w-JUST NOTARY.PDF

Priority Public Safety LLC. David Kirby dkirby@prioritypublicsafety.net

Dana Safety Supply Geoff Degioanni gdegioanni@danasafetysupply.com
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