
Type of Service

Brake Service (Flat Fee) Cost
Note on Break 

Category Cost
Note on Break 

Category Cost
Note on Break 

Category Cost Note on Break Category Cost Note on Break Category Cost Note on Break Category

1 Car Under 3800 lbs. GVW no bid $89.99 per hour

Per Mitchell Labor 

guide. Parts shall be 

marked up 10% over 

shop cost

$179.95 
$90.00 - Front or Rear 

Brakes, $80.00 Rear Drum
$94.34 $85.50 per per hour Parts Cost + 10%

2
Sport Utility Vehicle (SUV and Van 1/2 

to 1 Ton
no bid $89.99 per hour

Per Mitchell Labor 

guide. Parts shall be 

marked up 10% over 

shop cost

$179.95 
$90.00 - Front or Rear 

Brakes, $80.00 Rear Drum
$94.34 $85.50 per per hour Parts Cost + 10%

3 Pick-up 1/2 to 3/4 Ton no bid  $99.99 per hour 

Per Mitchell Labor 

guide. Parts shall be 

marked up 10% over 

shop cost

$189.95 
$90.00 - Front or Rear 

Brakes, $80.00 Rear Drum
$94.34 $85.50 per per hour Parts Cost + 10%

4 Pick-up 1 Ton to 1 1/2 Ton no bid $99.99 per hour

Per Mitchell Labor 

guide. Parts shall be 

marked up 10% over 

shop cost

no bid
$90.00 - Front or Rear 

Brakes, $80.00 Rear Drum
no bid $105.50 per hour Parts Cost + 10%

5 Medium Duty Truck no bid $159.99 per hour

Per Mitchell Labor 

guide. Parts shall be 

marked up 10% over 

shop cost

no bid no bid no bid %155.50 per hour Parts Cost + 10%

6 Police Sedan and SUV no bid $89.99 per hour

Per Mitchell Labor 

guide. Parts shall be 

marked up 10% over 

shop cost

$189.95 
$90.00 - Front or Rear 

Brakes, $80.00 Rear Drum
no bid $85.50 per hour Parts Cost + 10%

The Auto Shop - Jerry Kezhaya  972-578-0588  

Jerry@TheAutoShop.com

NTB- Greg Ingram - 561-383-3000 ext. 7060 

rthompson@tirekingdom.com

Kwik Kar- Tim Kaiser 972-396-1022  

tim@kwikkar400.com

 Craig's Car Care Inc- Craig Zale                       

972-941-6700  craig@craigscarcare.com

Good Year-   Tim Frost/Jeff  (East Main 

Street)       972-692-8084 

gsr4161@goodyear.com

Firestone - Billy Scoville 972-390-8741

Service and Repair for City of Allen Vehicle Fleet
Solicitation # 2016-9-194
Bid Tabulation



Type of Service
The Auto Shop - Jerry Kezhaya  972-578-0588  

Jerry@TheAutoShop.com

NTB- Greg Ingram - 561-383-3000 ext. 7060 

rthompson@tirekingdom.com

Kwik Kar- Tim Kaiser 972-396-1022  

tim@kwikkar400.com

 Craig's Car Care Inc- Craig Zale                       

972-941-6700  craig@craigscarcare.com

Good Year-   Tim Frost/Jeff  (East Main 

Street)       972-692-8084 

gsr4161@goodyear.com

Firestone - Billy Scoville 972-390-8741

Alignment (Flat Fee) Cost
Note on Break 

Category Cost
Note on Break 

Category Cost
Note on Break 

Category Cost Note on Break Category Cost Note on Break Category Cost Note on Break Category

7 Car Under 3800 lbs. GVW no bid $79.32 $69.95 $69.99 $76.49 $65.40 
For factory available 

adjustments

8
Sport Utility Vehicle (SUV and Van 1/2 

to 1 Ton
no bid $79.32 $69.95 $69.99 $76.49 $65.40 

For factory available 

adjustments

9 Pick-up 1/2 to 3/4 Ton no bid $79.32 $69.95 $69.99 $76.49 $65.40 
For factory available 

adjustments

10 Pick-up 1 Ton to 1 1/2 Ton no bid $99.99 no bid $69.99 no bid $105.50 
For factory available 

adjustments

11 Medium Duty Truck no bid $159.99 no bid $69.99 no bid no bid

Transmission Svc      

(Hourly Rate)
Cost

Note on Break 

Category Cost
Note on Break 

Category Cost
Note on Break 

Category Cost Note on Break Category Cost Note on Break Category Cost Note on Break Category

12 Car Under 3800 lbs. GVW no bid  $89.99 per hour 

Per Mitchell Labor 

guide. Parts shall be 

marked up 10% over 

shop cost

$129.95 Transmission Flush
$60.00 Fluid only, + $40.00 

pan & filter service
$94.34 plus parts $86.50 per hour Parts Cost + 10%

13
Sport Utility Vehicle (SUV and Van 1/2 

to 1 Ton
no bid  $89.99 per hour 

Per Mitchell Labor 

guide. Parts shall be 

marked up 10% over 

shop cost

$129.95 Transmission Flush
$60.00 Fluid only, + $40.00 

pan & filter service
$94.34 plus parts $86.50 per hour Parts Cost + 10%

14 Pick-up 1/2 to 3/4 Ton no bid  $89.99 per hour 

Per Mitchell Labor 

guide. Parts shall be 

marked up 10% over 

shop cost

$129.95 Transmission Flush
$60.00 Fluid only, + $40.00 

pan & filter service
no bid $86.50 per hour Parts Cost + 10%

15 Pick-up 1 Ton to 1 1/2 Ton no bid  $89.99 per hour 

Per Mitchell Labor 

guide. Parts shall be 

marked up 10% over 

shop cost

no bid
$60.00 Fluid only, + $40.00 

pan & filter service
no bid $86.50 per hour Parts Cost + 10%

16 Medium Duty Truck no bid  $89.99 per hour 

Per Mitchell Labor 

guide. Parts shall be 

marked up 10% over 

shop cost

no bid
$60.00 Fluid only, + $40.00 

pan & filter service
no bid $86.50 per hour Parts Cost + 10%

HVAC (Hourly Rate) Cost 

on Parts + % not to 

exceed 10%

Cost
Note on Break 

Category Cost
Note on Break 

Category Cost
Note on Break 

Category Cost Note on Break Category Cost Note on Break Category Cost Note on Break Category

17 Car Under 3800 lbs. GVW no bid  $89.99 per hour 

Per Mitchell Labor 

guide. Parts shall be 

marked up 10% over 

shop cost

no bid
$79.99 + $1.25 per oz of 

134A
$135.99 includes most materials $86.50 per hour Parts Cost + 10%

18
Sport Utility Vehicle (SUV and Van 1/2 

to 1 Ton
no bid  $89.99 per hour 

Per Mitchell Labor 

guide. Parts shall be 

marked up 10% over 

shop cost

no bid
$79.99 + $1.25 per oz of 

134A
$135.99 includes most materials $86.50 per hour Parts Cost + 10%



Type of Service
The Auto Shop - Jerry Kezhaya  972-578-0588  

Jerry@TheAutoShop.com

NTB- Greg Ingram - 561-383-3000 ext. 7060 

rthompson@tirekingdom.com

Kwik Kar- Tim Kaiser 972-396-1022  

tim@kwikkar400.com

 Craig's Car Care Inc- Craig Zale                       

972-941-6700  craig@craigscarcare.com

Good Year-   Tim Frost/Jeff  (East Main 

Street)       972-692-8084 

gsr4161@goodyear.com

Firestone - Billy Scoville 972-390-8741

19 Pick-up 1/2 to 3/4 Ton no bid  $89.99 per hour 

Per Mitchell Labor 

guide. Parts shall be 

marked up 10% over 

shop cost

no bid
$79.99 + $1.25 per oz of 

134A
$135.99 includes most materials $86.50 per hour Parts Cost + 10%

20 Pick-up 1 Ton to 1 1/2 Ton no bid  $99.99 per hour 

Per Mitchell Labor 

guide. Parts shall be 

marked up 10% over 

shop cost

no bid
$79.99 + $1.25 per oz of 

134A
no bid $105.50 per hour Parts Cost + 10%

21 Medium Duty Truck no bid  $150.99 per hour 

Per Mitchell Labor 

guide. Parts shall be 

marked up 10% over 

shop cost

no bid no bid no bid 155.50 per hour Parts Cost + 10%

Tune Up (Flat Fee) Cost 

on Parts + % not to 

exceed 10%

Cost
Note on Break 

Category Cost
Note on Break 

Category Cost
Note on Break 

Category Cost Note on Break Category Cost Note on Break Category Cost Note on Break Category

22 Car Under 3800 lbs. GVW no bid  $89.99 per hour 

Per Mitchell Labor 

guide. Parts shall be 

marked up 10% over 

shop cost

no bid $85.00 per hour 10% over MSRP $94.39 $86.50 per hour Parts Cost + 10%

23
Sport Utility Vehicle (SUV and Van 1/2 

to 1 Ton
no bid  $89.99 per hour 

Per Mitchell Labor 

guide. Parts shall be 

marked up 10% over 

shop cost

no bid $85.00 per hour 10% over MSRP $94.39 $86.50 per hour Parts Cost + 10%

24 Pick-up 1/2 to 3/4 Ton no bid  $89.99 per hour 

Per Mitchell Labor 

guide. Parts shall be 

marked up 10% over 

shop cost

no bid $85.00 per hour 10% over MSRP $94.39 $86.50 per hour Parts Cost + 10%

25 Pick-up 1 Ton to 1 1/2 Ton no bid 99.99 per hour

Per Mitchell Labor 

guide. Parts shall be 

marked up 10% over 

shop cost

no bid $85.00 per hour 10% over MSRP no bid $105.50 per hour Parts Cost + 10%

26 Medium Duty Truck no bid  $150.99 per hour 

Per Mitchell Labor 

guide. Parts shall be 

marked up 10% over 

shop cost

no bid $85.00 per hour 10% over MSRP no bid 155.50 per hour Parts Cost + 10%

27
If applicable, provide additional pricing 

as needed on various cylinder sizes
no bid  $89.00 per hour 

Per Mitchell Labor 

guide. Parts shall be 

marked up 10% over 

shop cost

no bid $85.00 per hour 10% over MSRP no bid no bid



Type of Service
The Auto Shop - Jerry Kezhaya  972-578-0588  

Jerry@TheAutoShop.com

NTB- Greg Ingram - 561-383-3000 ext. 7060 

rthompson@tirekingdom.com

Kwik Kar- Tim Kaiser 972-396-1022  

tim@kwikkar400.com

 Craig's Car Care Inc- Craig Zale                       

972-941-6700  craig@craigscarcare.com

Good Year-   Tim Frost/Jeff  (East Main 

Street)       972-692-8084 

gsr4161@goodyear.com

Firestone - Billy Scoville 972-390-8741

Oil, Filter and lubrication (Syn 

and non Syn) "Flat Fee"
Cost

Note on Break 

Category
Cost

Note on Break 

Category
Cost

Note on Break 

Category
Cost Note on Break Category Cost Note on Break Category Cost Note on Break Category

28 Car Under 3800 lbs. GVW

$35.99 - up to 5 quarts 

of conventional Pennzoil, 

$51.29 - u to 5 quarts 

semi-synthetic Pennzoil, 

$56.69 to 5 quarts full 

synthetic Pennzoil

$45.18 Synthetic / 

$28.19 Standard

For Synthetic Oil up to 6 

quarts.  $6.93 per 

quarts for oil past 6 qts. 

For standard oil up to 6 

quarts. $4.95 per quart

$27.95 Standard 

/ $44.95 

Synthetic Oil 

Change

$27.99 = includes $8.50 

labor + $3.99 filter+ non-syn 

oil @ $15.50 (up to 5 qts).  

$54.99= includes $8.50 labor 

= 12.99 filter+ Synthetic oil 

@ $ 33.50 (up to 5 qts)

$8.50 labor $3.99 - 

$12.99 per filter

$54.00 Synthetic/$26.99 

Non-Synthetic up to 5.5 

Qts.

$39.95 Gas Engine up to 6 

Qts of Synthetic Oil / 

$24.95 Gas Engines up to 6 

Qts Standard Oil

29
Sport Utility Vehicle (SUV and Van 1/2 

to 1 Ton

$35.99 - up to 5 quarts 

of conventional Pennzoil, 

$51.29 - u to 5 quarts 

semi-synthetic Pennzoil, 

$56.69 to 5 quarts full 

synthetic Pennzoil

$45.18 Synthetic / 

$28.19 Standard

For Synthetic Oil up to 6 

quarts.  $6.93 per 

quarts for oil past 6 qts. 

For standard oil up to 6 

quarts. $4.95 per quart

$27.95 Standard 

/ $44.95 

Synthetic Oil 

Change

$27.99 = includes $8.50 

labor + $3.99 filter+ non-syn 

oil @ $15.50 (up to 5 qts).  

$54.99= includes $8.50 labor 

= 12.99 filter+ Synthetic oil 

@ $ 33.50 (up to 5 qts)

$8.50 labor $3.99 - 

$12.99 per filter

$54.00 Synthetic/$26.99 

Non-Synthetic up to 5.5 

Qts.

$39.95 Gas Engine up to 6 

Qts of Synthetic Oil / 

$24.95 Gas Engines up to 6 

Qts Standard Oil

30 Pick-up 1/2 to 3/4 Ton

$35.99 - up to 5 quarts 

of conventional Pennzoil, 

$51.29 - u to 5 quarts 

semi-synthetic Pennzoil, 

$56.69 to 5 quarts full 

synthetic Pennzoil

$45.18 Synthetic / 

$28.19 Standard

For Synthetic Oil up to 6 

quarts.  $6.93 per 

quarts for oil past 6 qts. 

For standard oil up to 6 

quarts. $4.95 per quart

$27.95 Standard 

/ $44.95 

Synthetic Oil 

Change

$27.99 = includes $8.50 

labor + $3.99 filter+ non-syn 

oil @ $15.50 (up to 5 qts).  

$54.99= includes $8.50 labor 

= 12.99 filter+ Synthetic oil 

@ $ 33.50 (up to 5 qts)

$8.50 labor $3.99 - 

$12.99 per filter

$54.00 Synthetic/$26.99 

Non-Synthetic up to 5.5 

Qts.

$39.95 Gas Engine up to 6 

Qts of Synthetic Oil / 

$24.95 Gas Engines up to 6 

Qts Standard Oil

31 Pick-up 1 Ton to 1 and 1/2 ton

$35.99 - up to 5 quarts 

of conventional Pennzoil, 

$51.29 - u to 5 quarts 

semi-synthetic Pennzoil, 

$56.69 to 5 quarts full 

synthetic Pennzoil

$45.18 Synthetic / 

$28.19 Standard

For Synthetic Oil up to 6 

quarts.  $6.93 per 

quarts for oil past 6 qts. 

For standard oil up to 6 

quarts. $4.95 per quart

$59.99 Diesel Oil 

Change - 10 

Quarts, $103.99 

Diesel Oil 

Change 15 

Quarts and 

$169.99 Diesel 

Synthetic Oil 

Change 15 Qts

$27.99 = includes $8.50 

labor + $3.99 filter+ non-syn 

oil @ $15.50 (up to 5 qts).  

$54.99= includes $8.50 labor 

= 12.99 filter+ Synthetic oil 

@ $ 33.50 (up to 5 qts)

$8.50 labor $3.99 - 

$12.99 per filter
no  bid

$63.95 - Gas Engine up to 6 

Qts of Synthetic Oil/ $49.95 

Gas Engines up to 6 Qts 

Standard Oil

32 Medium Duty Truck

$35.99 - up to 5 quarts 

of conventional Pennzoil, 

$51.29 - u to 5 quarts 

semi-synthetic Pennzoil, 

$56.69 to 5 quarts full 

synthetic Pennzoil

$241.42 Synthetic/  

$192.10 Standard

For Synthetic Oil up to 7 

gallons $27.72 per 

galon for oil past 7 

gallons.  For standard 

oil up t o7 gallons. 

$19.80 per gallon

no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

33
Cost per quart on all non-synthetic oil, 

each 1 quart

$6.49 per quart 

conventional Pennzoil
$4.95 $3.25 

$15.50 up to 5 qts, $3.10 per 

additional quart
Conventional Oil $3.08 $4.38 

34
Cost per quart of all synthetic oil, each 

at 1 quart

$6.99 per quart semi-

synthetic Pennzoil $9.99 

per quart full synthetic 

Pennzoil

$6.93 

Note:  Diesel trucks 3/4 

to 1-1/2 tons GVW is 

$112.98 for Synthetic 

up to 3 gallons and 

$90.38 for non-

synthetic up to 3 gallons

$8.25 

Dexos Oil - GM's Synthetic  

Blend @$25.50 up to 5 qts 

@ $5.10 additional qts.  FULL 

Synthetic Oil $33.50 up to 5 

qts @ $6.70 each add'l qt

$8.49 $6.14 



Type of Service
The Auto Shop - Jerry Kezhaya  972-578-0588  

Jerry@TheAutoShop.com

NTB- Greg Ingram - 561-383-3000 ext. 7060 

rthompson@tirekingdom.com

Kwik Kar- Tim Kaiser 972-396-1022  

tim@kwikkar400.com

 Craig's Car Care Inc- Craig Zale                       

972-941-6700  craig@craigscarcare.com

Good Year-   Tim Frost/Jeff  (East Main 

Street)       972-692-8084 

gsr4161@goodyear.com

Firestone - Billy Scoville 972-390-8741

Battery Removal and 

Replacement (Flat Fee)
Cost

Note on Break 

Category Cost
Note on Break 

Category Cost
Note on Break 

Category Cost Note on Break Category Cost Note on Break Category Cost Note on Break Category

34 Car Under 3800 lbs. GVW

$153.00- 24 month/5 

year warranty - 

Interstate Battery

 $18.08 labor only 

Includes labor parts 

battery to be marked up 

no marked up no more 

than 10% over shopt 

cost

$9.95 $15.00 $11.04 labor only Does not include parts
$16.00 Standard Labor 

Only

35
Sport Utility Vehicle (SUV and Van 1/2 

to 1 Ton

$153.00- 24 month/5 

year warranty - 

Interstate Battery

 $18.08 labor only 

Includes labor parts 

battery to be marked up 

no marked up no more 

than 10% over shop 

cost

$9.95 $15.00 $11.04 labor only Does not include parts
$16.00 Standard Labor 

Only

36 Pick-up 1/2 to 3/4 Ton

$153.00- 24 month/5 

year warranty - 

Interstate Battery

 $18.08 labor only 

Includes labor parts 

battery to be marked up 

no marked up no more 

than 10% over shop 

cost

$9.95 $15.00 $11.04 labor only Does not include parts
$16.00 Standard Labor 

Only

37 Pick-up 1 Ton to 1 1/2 Ton

$153.00- 24 month/5 

year warranty - 

Interstate Battery

 $18.08 labor only 

Includes labor parts 

battery to be marked up 

no marked up no more 

than 10% over shop 

cost

$9.95 $15.00 no bid
$24.00 Standard Labor 

Only

38 Medium Duty Truck

$175.00-24 Month/5 

Year warranty-Interstate 

Battery

 $35.00 Labor only 

Includes labor parts 

battery to be marked up 

no marked up no more 

than 10% over shop 

cost

no bid $15.00 no bid
$35.00 Standard Labor 

Only

Discount off list price for items not 

listed in the bid document to be 

offered to the City of Allen

What is your flat fee for diagnostics?

Do you offer warranty on Parts if yes 

what is the warranty?
Yes See Warranty Guide

Do you offer warranty on Labor?  If 

yes, what is the warranty?
Yes See Warranty Guide

Provide the name of the National 

Industry Standard Manual, Electronic 

Database and Price Lists you are using

Mitchell

$102.00 

Michell

N/A
$89.99 per hour billed in 30 minute 

increments

Yes - 1 year

yes- 1 year

AllDATA

Yes - 12 months/12,000 Miles

Yes - 12 months/12,000 Miles

Michell

The Auto Shop

15%10% 10% 10% 10% 15%

Kwik Kar of Allen Craig's Car Care Goodyear Firestone NTB

$89.99 

Yes- 12 months/12,000 Miles (some parts have 

greater warranties)

Yes- 12 months/12,000 Miles 

Michell

$94.39 

no

no

$85.50 per clock hour for vehicle up to 1 ton

Yes - 12 months/12,000 miles

Yes - 12 months/12,000 miles

AllData, Mitchell and Identifix



Type of Service
The Auto Shop - Jerry Kezhaya  972-578-0588  

Jerry@TheAutoShop.com

NTB- Greg Ingram - 561-383-3000 ext. 7060 

rthompson@tirekingdom.com

Kwik Kar- Tim Kaiser 972-396-1022  

tim@kwikkar400.com

 Craig's Car Care Inc- Craig Zale                       

972-941-6700  craig@craigscarcare.com

Good Year-   Tim Frost/Jeff  (East Main 

Street)       972-692-8084 

gsr4161@goodyear.com

Firestone - Billy Scoville 972-390-8741

Transmission Pricing

Provide your price transmission rebuild 

and replacement price range for all 

vehicle models and makes in the years 

2008 through 2017.  Vehicle models 

include but are not limited to: Ford 

(Inteceptor Sedan, SUV, 250 Trucks), 

Dodge Chargers, Chevy Tahoes

Trailer Maintenance and Repair

Does your entity provide trailer 

maintenance and repair for open and 

closed bed trailers?

Axles

Suspension

Wheels and Tires

Ramp Work

Brakes (including Anti-Brake Systems)

Hydraulic Winch

Lights and Reflectors

Paint

Mud Flaps

Electrical

Note- Since the city's trailers can range from 

1500 lbs./GVW to over 30,000lbs. GVW the 

price range is wide to cover both the light 

duty and heavy duty units we may be asked 

to maintain to repair.

no bid

no bid

$112-$185

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

Goodyear

no bid

Goodyear

Just on tires

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

Craig's Car Care

$359.96 to $1,079.88 for transmission 

removal and replacement and transmission 

cooler flushing and reprograming as needed- 

10% over transmission cost for Parts

Craig's Car Care

Yes

$100.00 - $3,500.00

$100.00 - $3,500.00

$50.00 - $500.00 each

$50.00 - $2000.00 

$50.00 - $2000.00 

$30.00 - $3,500.00

$15.00 - $1000,00

no bid

$30.00 - $200.00

$25.00 - $750.00

Kwik Kar

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

Kwik Kar

Firestone

For Wheels and Tires, Lights/Reflectors and Mud Flaps

$45-$150

no bid

Firestone

no bid

NTB

no bid

NTB

no

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

Varies

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

$2,200 - $3,500.00

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

The Auto Shop

$1495.00 - $2495.00

The Auto Shop

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

ALL BIDS SUBMITTED FOR THE DESIGNATED PROJECT ARE REFLECTED ON THIS SHEET.  HOWEVER, THE LISTING OF A BIDDER ON THIS SHEET SHOULD NOT BE CONSTRUED AS A 
COMMENT ON THE RESPONSIVENESS OF SUCH A BID OR AS ANY INDICATION THAT THE CITY ACCEPTS SUCH BIDS AS RESPONSIVE.   THE CITY WILL MAKE A DETERMINATION AS TO THE 
RESPONSIVENESS OF BIDS SUBMITTED BASED UPON COMPLIANCE WITH ALL APPLICABLE LAWS, CITY OF ALLEN PURCHASING GUIDELINES AND PROJECT DOCUMENTS.  INCLUDING BUT 
NOT LIMITED TO THE PROJECT SPECIFICATIONS AND CONTRACT DOCUMENTS.  THE CITY WILL NOTIFY THE SUCCESSFUL BIDDER UPON AWARD OF THE CONTRACT AND ACCORDING TO 
LAW, ALL BIDS RECEIVED WILL BE AVAILABLE FOR INSPECTION AT THAT TIME.


